Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE FOR GOODS AND SERVICES
Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING THE SINGLE CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE
BID (SCRB) / LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BID (LCRB) AND
RECOMMENDING THE AWARD OF CONTRACT

RESOLUTION NO. PB066-2024

BIDDING NO.: PURCHASE REQUEST NO. 2024-04-186

Category per RA9184: [ X ] GOODS [ ] INFRA/WORKS [] CONSULTING
TITLE/DESCRIPTION: “SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF NON-CONTROLLED
CHEMICALS AND REAGENTS (APP 2024-15T QUARTER)”

APPROVED BUDGET FOR THE CONTRACT (ABC): P 2,372,494.91

WHEREAS, the TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY advertised the Invitation to Bid for
the project Supply and Delivery of Non-Controlled Chemicals and Reagents (APP 2024-
1st Quarter) with an Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC) of ® 2,372,494.91 in the
Philippine Government Electronic Procurement System (PhilGEPS) and in conspicuous
places in Tarlac State University on May 15, 2024;

WHEREAS, in response to the Invitation to Bid, one (1) prospective bidder
participated in the Pre-Bidding Conference held at Tarlac State University BAC
Conference Room and webcasted via Zoom on May 23, 2024;

WHEREAS, in the public bidding held at the TSU BAC Conference Room on June
5, 2024, at 2:00 P.M.:

(a) Two bidders, namely, Chemline Scientific Corporation and Krypton
International Resources Sales and Services Inc. tendered their bids for the
aforementioned project,

(b) the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC), with the assistance of the Technical
Working Groups (TWGs), opened and checked the first envelopes contained
in the bids submitted by the two bidders, using the non-discretionary “pass/fail”
criterion, and found the first envelopes of Chemline Scientific Corporation and
Krypton International Resources Sales and Services Inc. to contain all the
required documents and were rated “passed”.

(c) the BAC with the assistance of the TWGs, proceeded with the opering and
evaluation of the second envelopes of the two bidders and fowﬁd that the
envelopes of the two bidders contained the prescribed documents and were
rated “passed”;

(d) the BAC, with the assistance of the TWGs, evaluated and ranked the bids of
the two bidders whose first and second envelopes were rated “passed”,

(a) the BAC resolved to declare Chemline Scientific Corporation as the bidder with
the Lowest Calculated Bid (LCB)/ Single Calculated Bid (SCB) with an
aggregate amount of  679,702.00 for the following item numbers.

Item No. 8 with the bid price of # 3,200.00,
Iltem No. 9 with the bid price of # 11,800.00,
Item No. 20 with the bid price of £ 2,000.00,
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Item No. 21 with the bid price of # 1,500.00,
Item No. 25 with the bid price of £ 5,000.00,
Item No. 26 with the bid price of £ 2,400.00,
Item No. 33 with the bid price of # 3,000.00,
Item No. 39 with the bid price of # 9,900.00,
Item No. 41 with the bid price of # 15,600.00,
Item No. 42 with the bid price of £ 18,000.00,
Item No. 45 with the bid price of # 46,400.00,
Item No. 49 with the bid price of £ 21,000.00,
Iltem No. 51 with the bid price of £ 2,500.00,
Iltem No. 57 with the bid price of £ 25,200.00,
Item No. 62 with the bid price of £ 1,600.00,
Item No. 63 with the bid price of # 4,500.00,
Item No. 65 with the bid price of # 6,500.00,
Item No. 70 with the bid price of £ 2,200.00,
Iltem No. 72 with the bid price of £ 36,000.00,
Item No. 74 with the bid price of # 17,000.00,
Item No. 75 with the bid price of # 17,400.00,
Item No. 79 with the bid price of £ 28,000.00,
Item No. 80 with the bid price of £ 13,000.00,
Item No. 81 with the bid price of # 3,500.00,
Item No. 86 with the bid price of # 24,402.00,
Item No. 87 with the bid price of # 19,800.00,
Item No. 88 with the bid price of £ 20,800.00,
Item No. 91 with the bid price of £ 9,760.00,
Iltem No. 102 with the bid price of £ 4,500.00,
Iltem No. 105 with the bid price of £ 8,200.00,
Iltem No. 108 with the bid price of £ 2,320.00,
Item No. 109 with the bid price of # 1,760.00,
Item No. 110 with the bid price of £ 4,800.00,
Item No. 111 with the bid price of  7,300.00,
Item No. 114 with the bid price of # 2,400.00,
Item No. 115 with the bid price of £ 2,500.00,
Item No. 130 with the bid price of # 8,400.00,
Iltem No. 133 with the bid price of # 28,800.00,
Item No. 135 with the bid price of # 34,000.00,
Item No. 136 with the bid price of # 34,800.00,
Item No. 137 with the bid price of £ 21,000.00,
Item No. 138 with the bid price of # 19,500.00,
Iltem No. 141 with the bid price of # 16,200.00,
Item No. 142 with the bid price of # 16,710.00,
Iltem No. 144 with the bid price of # 4,500.00,
Item No. 145 with the bid price of # 4,500.00,
Item No. 147 with the bid price of £ 1,200.00,
Item No. 148 with the bid price of £ 4,000.00,
Item No. 149 with the bid price of £ 70,000.00,
Item No. 152 with the bid price of # 6,000.00,
Item No. 153 with the bid price of # 4,350.00,

(b) to declare Krypton International Resources Sales and Services Inc., as the
bidder with the Lowest Calculated Bid (LCB) / Single Calculated Bid (SCB) with
an aggregate amount of # 186,700.00 for the following item numbers.

Item No. 17 with the bid price of # 2,000.00,
Item No. 22 with the bid price of # 6,500.00
Item No. 52 with the bid price of # 3,000.00,
Item No. 54 with the bid price of £ 8,000.00,
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Item No. 60 with the bid price of £ 20,000.00,
Item No. 68 with the bid price of # 15,000.00,
Item No. 73 with the bid price of £ 33,500.00,
Item No. 92 with the bid price of £ 15,000.00,
Item No. 112 with the bid price of # 15,000.00,
Item No. 131 with the bid price of £ 9,900.00,
Item No. 134 with the bid price of £ 26,800.00,
Item No. 140 with the bid price of # 32,000.00,

(e) the BAC directed the TWGs to proceed with the post-qualification evaluation of
the LCB and SCB;

(f) to declare a Failure of Bidding for Item No. 121, bids exceeded the allotted
budget and,

(c) to declare a Failure of Bidding for Item Nos. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 10, 11, 12, 13,
14,15, 16, 18, 19, 23, 24, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 40, 43, 44,
46, 47, 48, 50, 53, 55, 56, 58, 59, 61, 64, 66, 67,69, 71, 76, 77, 78, 82, 83, 84,
85, 89, 90, 93, 94, 95, 96, 97, 98, 99, 100, 101, 103, 104, 106, 107, 113, 116,
117, 118, 119, 120, 122, 123, 124, 125, 126, 127, 128, 129, 132, 139, 143,
146, 150, 151, and 154 no bid was received,

(g9) to recommend to the President the procurement of ltem Nos. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7,
10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 18, 19, 23, 24, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 34, 35, 36, 37,
38,40, 43, 44, 46, 47, 48, 50, 53, 55, 56, 58, 59, 61, 64, 66, 67,69, 71, 76, 77,
78, 82, 83, 84, 85, 89, 90, 93, 94, 95, 96, 97, 98, 99, 100, 101, 103, 104, 106,
107, 113, 116, 117, 118, 119, 120, 121, 122, 123, 124, 125, 126, 127, 128,
129, 132, 139, 143, 145, 146, 150, 151, and 154 of the project Supply and
Delivery of Non-Controlled Chemicals and Reagents (APP 2024-1%t Quarter)
using the appropriate alternative mode of procurement in accordance with the
Implementing Rules and Regulations of R. A. 9184.

WHEREAS, in the Post-Qualification Evaluation Conference held at the TSU BAC
Conference Room on July 19, 2024:

(a) the TWG for the Legal and Financial Aspects reported that the LCB and SCB
was responsive to the legal and financial requirements for the project as
prescribed in the Bidding Documents,

(b) the TWG for Technical Aspect reported that the LCB and SCB was responsive
to the technical requirements for the project as prescribed in the Bidding
Documents, and

(c) the BAC verified the reports of the TWGs, deliberated, and unanimously
agreed to declare the LCB and SCB as responsive;

THEREFORE, We, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby
RESOLVE, as it is hereby RESOLVED:

(a) to declare Chemline Scientific Corporation, as the bidder with the Lowest
Calculated and Responsive Bid (LCRB)/ Single Calculated and Responsive Bid
(SCB) with an aggregate amount of 679,702.00 for the following item
numbers.

Iltem No. 8 with the bid price of  3,200.00,
Iltem No. 9 with the bid price of # 11,800.00,
Item No. 20 with the bid price of # 2,000.00,
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Item No. 21 with the bid price of # 1,500.00,
Item No. 25 with the bid price of  5,000.00,
Item No. 26 with the bid price of # 2,400.00,
Item No. 33 with the bid price of # 3,000.00,
Item No. 39 with the bid price of  9,900.00,
Item No. 41 with the bid price of # 15,600.00,
Item No. 42 with the bid price of # 18,000.00,
Item No. 45 with the bid price of # 46,400.00,
Item No. 49 with the bid price of  21,000.00,
Item No. 51 with the bid price of # 2,500.00,
Item No. 57 with the bid price of # 25,200.00,
Item No. 62 with the bid price of £ 1,600.00,
Item No. 63 with the bid price of # 4,500.00,
Item No. 65 with the bid price of  6,500.00,
Item No. 70 with the bid price of £ 2,200.00,
Item No. 72 with the bid price of  36,000.00,
Item No. 74 with the bid price of # 17,000.00,
Iltem No. 75 with the bid price of  17,400.00,
Item No. 79 with the bid price of # 28,000.00,
Item No. 80 with the bid price of # 13,000.00,
Item No. 81 with the bid price of # 3,500.00,
Item No. 86 with the bid price of  24,402.00,
Item No. 87 with the bid price of # 19,800.00,
Item No. 88 with the bid price of £ 20,800.00,
Item No. 91 with the bid price of £ 9,760.00,
Item No. 102 with the bid price of £ 4,500.00,
Iltem No. 105 with the bid price of £ 8,200.00,
Iltem No. 108 with the bid price of £ 2,320.00,
Item No. 109 with the bid price of # 1,760.00,
Item No. 110 with the bid price of £ 4,800.00,
Item No. 111 with the bid price of  7,300.00,
Item No. 114 with the bid price of £ 2,400.00,
Item No. 115 with the bid price of # 2,500.00,
Item No. 130 with the bid price of # 8,400.00,
Iltem No. 133 with the bid price of # 28,800.00,
Item No. 135 with the bid price of # 34,000.00,
Item No. 136 with the bid price of £ 34,800.00,
Item No. 137 with the bid price of £ 21,000.00,
Item No. 138 with the bid price of # 19,500.00,
Item No. 141 with the bid price of £ 16,200.00,
Item No. 142 with the bid price of # 16,710.00,
Item No. 144 with the bid price of # 4,500.00,
Item No. 145 with the bid price of # 4,500.00,
Item No. 147 with the bid price of # 1,200.00,
Item No. 148 with the bid price of £ 4,000.00,
Item No. 149 with the bid price of £ 70,000.00,
Item No. 152 with the bid price of  6,000.00,
Item No. 153 with the bid price of # 4,350.00,

(b) to declare Krypton International Resources Sales and Services Inc., as the
bidder with the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid (LCRB) / Single
Calculated and Responsive Bid (SCRB) with an aggregate amount of #
186,700.00 for the following item numbers.

Item No. 17 with the bid price of £ 2,000.00,
Item No. 22 with the bid price of £ 6,500.00
Item No. 52 with the bid price of £ 3,000.00,
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Item No. 54 with the bid price of £ 8,000.00,
Item No. 60 with the bid price of # 20,000.00,
Item No. 68 with the bid price of # 15,000.00,
Item No. 73 with the bid price of # 33,500.00,
Item No. 92 with the bid price of  15,000.00,
Item No. 112 with the bid price of £ 15,000.00,
Item No. 131 with the bid price of # 9,900.00,
Iltem No. 134 with the bid price of £ 26,800.00,
Item No. 140 with the bid price of # 32,000.00,

(c) to recommend to the President the Award of Contract for the project Supply
and Delivery of Non-Controlled Chemicals and Reagents (APP 2024-1st
Quarter) to Chemline Scientific Corporation for item nos. 8, 9, 20, 21, 25, 26,
33, 39, 41, 42, 45, 49, 51, 57, 62, 63, 65, 70, 72, 74, 75, 79, 80, 81, 86, 87, 88,
91, 102, 105, 108, 109, 110, 111, 114, 115, 130, 133, 135, 136, 137, 138, 141,
142, 144, 145, 147, 148, 149, 152, and 153.

(d) to recommend to the President the Award of Contract for the project Supply
and Delivery of Non-Controlled Chemicals and Reagents (APP 2024-1st

Quarter) to Krypton International Resources Sales and Services Inc., for item
nos. 17, 22, 52, 54, 60, 68, 73, 92, 112, 131, 134, and 140.

RESOLVED, at TSU-BC AVR, this 19" day of July 2024.

GRA@RUSETE RICO G/ TOMAS

Chajrperson V[ce Chairpers
THEDA FLARE é.QUILALA ROMMEL M. HERNANDEZ
Member Membér’
MENCHIE DG. ABELLAR JASPER A. YAUDER
Member Member
ELEWTEOHLO
Merﬁge(/End-user
Approved:
Dé.)(lfnaNo E. VELASCO
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Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
Goods and Services

Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarl

lac City

Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630

Website: www.tsu.edu.p

h

ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS READ

Project Name: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF NON-CONTROLLED CHEMICALS AND
REAGENTS (APP 2024-1°T QUARTER)

Project Location: Main Campus, Tarlac State University

Implementing Office: Tarlac State University
Approved Budget for the Contract: ® 2,372,494.91

Date: June 5, 2024

Time: 2:00 P.M.
Venue: BAC Conference Room

BIDDER CHEMILINE SCIENTIFIC KRYPTON INTERNATIONAL
CORPORATION RESOURCES SALES AND
SERVICES INC.
Iltem No. 1 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 2 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 3 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 4 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 5 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 6 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 7 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 8 3,200.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 9 11,800.00 NO BID
ltem No. 10 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 11 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 12 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 13 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 14 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 15 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 16 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 17 NO BID 2,000.00
ltem No. 18 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 19 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 20 2,000.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 21 1,500.00 NO BID
Item No. 22 NO BID 6,500.00
(500g/bottle)
Iltem No. 23 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 24 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 25 5,000.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 26 2,400.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 27 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 28 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 29 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 30 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 31 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 32 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 33 3,000.00 NO BID
ltem No. 34 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 35 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 36 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 37 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 38 NO BID NO BID
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Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Goods and Services
Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

Iltem No. 39 9,900.00 10,000.00
(1L/bottle)
ltem No. 40 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 41 15,600.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 42 18,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 43 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 44 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 45 46,400.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 46 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 47 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 48 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 49 21,000.00 NO BID
(2.5L/bottle)
Iltem No. 50 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 51 2,500.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 52 NO BID 3,000.00
Iltem No. 53 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 54 NO BID 8,000.00
(1kg/bottle)
Item No. 55 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 56 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 57 25,200.00 39,000.00
(1L/bottle)
ltem No. 58 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 59 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 60 30,000.00 20,000.00
(1L/bottle)
Iltem No. 61 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 62 1,600.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 63 4,500.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 64 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 65 6,500.00 6,630.00
Item No. 66 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 67 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 68 15,600.00 15,000.00
Iltem No. 69 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 70 2,200.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 71 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 72 36,000.00 55,000.00
Iltem No. 73 35,000.00 33,500.00
ltem No. 74 17,000.00 18,000.00
ltem No. 75 17,400.00 NO BID
Item No. 76 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 77 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 78 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 79 28,000.00 32,000.00
Iltem No. 80 13,000.00 15,000.00
Iltem No. 81 3,500.00 NO BID
Item No. 82 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 83 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 84 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 85 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 86 24,402.00 65,000.00
(4L/bottle) (2.5L/bottle)
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Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Goods and Services
Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

ltem No. 87 19,800.00 NO BID
ltem No. 88 20,800.00 NO BID
ltem No. 89 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 90 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 91 9,760.00 NO BID
ltem No. 92 NO BID 15,000.00
ltem No. 93 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 94 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 95 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 96 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 97 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 98 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 99 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 100 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 101 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 102 4,500.00 NO BID
ltem No. 103 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 104 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 105 8,200.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 106 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 107 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 108 2,320.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 109 1,760.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 110 4,800.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 111 7,300.00 NO BID
ltem No. 112 NO BID 15,000.00
Iltem No. 113 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 114 2,400.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 115 2,500.00 5,500.00
Iltem No. 116 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 117 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 118 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 119 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 120 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 121 9,000.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 122 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 123 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 124 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 125 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 126 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 127 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 128 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 129 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 130 8,400.00 NO BID
ltem No. 131 10,400.00 9,900.00
ltem No. 132 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 133 28,800.00 41,600.00
ltem No. 134 28,000.00 26,800.00
ltem No. 135 34,000.00 35,000.00
Iltem No. 136 34,800.00 NO BID
ltem No. 137 21,000.00 24,000.00
ltem No. 138 19,500.00 21,000.00
Iltem No. 139 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 140 32,000.00 32,000.00
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Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Goods and Services
Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.fsu.edu.ph

Item No. 141 16,200.00 NO BID
Item No. 142 16,710.00 NO BID
Item No. 143 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 144 4,500.00 NO BID
Item No. 145 4,500.00 NO BID
Item No. 146 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 147 1,200.00 NO BID
Item No. 148 4,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 149 70,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 150 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 151 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 152 6,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 153 4,350.00 NO BID
Item No. 154 NO BID - NO BID
Aggregate Bid Amount P 659,907 P 186,700.00
Form of Bid Security Bid Securing Declaration Bid Securing Declaration
Validity Period 120 days 120 days
Remarks Complying / Complying
GRAC Rlﬁ OMAS
Chalrpe‘son Chairperson
THEDA FLAa QUILALA ROMMEL M. H NDEZ MENCHIE D@tyABELLAR
Member Membél r Member
JASPER A. YAUDER ELENA MAY T. TEOFILO
Member , Member/ End-user
WINNIEFE\FGUTIERREZ RYAN@. SIH
TWG on Financial and Legal Aspects TWG on Tecrnical Aspects
Chairperson Chaifperson
Approved:
uﬁ({ﬁno@:égEmsco
i J }'r&‘idﬁ\t
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Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
Goods and Services

Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tar

lac City

Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630

Website: www.tsu.edu.p

h

ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS CALCULATED

Project Name: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF NON-CONTROLLED CHEMICALS AND
REAGENTS (APP 2024-1°T QUARTER)

Project Location: Main Campus, Tarlac State University
Implementing Office: Tarlac State University

Approved Budget for the Contract: # 2,372,494.91

Date: June 5, 2024

Time: 2:00 P.M.
Venue: BAC Conference Room

BIDDER CHEMILINE SCIENTIFIC KRYPTON INTERNATIONAL
CORPORATION RESOURCES SALES AND
SERVICES INC.
Iltem No. 1 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 2 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 3 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 4 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 5 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 6 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 7 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 8 3,200.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 9 11,800.00 NO BID
ltem No. 10 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 11 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 12 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 13 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 14 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 15 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 16 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 17 NO BID 2,000.00
Item No. 18 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 19 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 20 2,000.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 21 1,500.00 NO BID
ltem No. 22 NO BID 6,500.00
(500g/bottle)
ltem No. 23 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 24 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 25 5,000.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 26 2,400.00 NO BID
ltem No. 27 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 28 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 29 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 30 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 31 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 32 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 33 3,000.00 NO BID
ltem No. 34 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 35 NO BID NO BID
Iltem No. 36 NO BID NO BID
ltem No. 37 NO BID NO BID
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Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
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Item No. 38 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 39 9,900.00 10,000.00
(1L/bottle)
Item No. 40 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 41 15,600.00 NO BID
Item No. 42 18,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 43 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 44 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 45 46,400.00 NO BID
Item No. 46 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 47 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 48 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 49 21,000.00 NO BID
(2.5L/bottle)
Item No. 50 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 51 2,500.00 NO BID
Item No. 52 NO BID 3,000.00
Item No. 53 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 54 NO BID 8,000.00
(1kg/bottle)
Item No. 55 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 56 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 57 25,200.00 39,000.00
(1L/bottle)
Item No. 58 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 59 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 60 30,000.00 20,000.00
(1L/bottle)
Item No. 61 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 62 1,600.00 NO BID
Item No. 63 4,500.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 64 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 65 6,500.00 6,630.00
Item No. 66 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 67 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 68 15,600.00 15,000.00
Item No. 69 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 70 2,200.00 NO BID
Item No. 71 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 72 36,000.00 55,000.00
Item No. 73 35,000.00 33,500.00
Item No. 74 17,000.00 18,000.00
Item No. 75 17,400.00 NO BID
Item No. 76 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 77 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 78 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 79 28,000.00 32,000.00
Item No. 80 13,000.00 15,000.00
Item No. 81 3,500.00 NO BID
ltem No. 82 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 83 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 84 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 85 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 86 24,402.00 65,000.00
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(4L/bottle) (2.5L/bottle)
Item No. 87 19,800.00 NO BID
Item No. 88 20,800.00 NO BID
Item No. 89 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 90 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 91 9,760.00 NO BID
Item No. 92 NO BID 15,000.00
Item No. 93 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 94 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 95 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 96 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 97 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 98 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 99 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 100 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 101 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 102 4,500.00 NO BID
Item No. 103 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 104 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 105 8,200.00 NO BID
[tem No. 106 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 107 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 108 2,320.00 NO BID
Item No. 109 1,760.00 NO BID
Item No. 110 4,800.00 NO BID
Item No. 111 7,300.00 NO BID
Item No. 112 NO BID 15,000.00
Item No. 113 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 114 2,400.00 NO BID
Item No. 115 2,500.00 5,500.00
Item No. 116 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 117 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 118 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 119 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 120 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 121 9,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 122 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 123 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 124 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 125 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 126 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 127 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 128 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 129 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 130 8,400.00 NO BID
Item No. 131 10,400.00 9,900.00
Item No. 132 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 133 28,800.00 41,600.00
Item No. 134 28,000.00 26,800.00
Item No. 135 34,000.00 35,000.00
Item No. 136 34,800.00 NO BID
Item No. 137 21,000.00 24,000.00
Item No. 138 19,500.00 21,000.00
Item No. 139 NO BID NO BID

Page 7 of 8



Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Goods and Services
Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.fsu.edu.ph

Item No. 140 32,000.00 32,000.00
Item No. 141 16,200.00 NO BID
Item No. 142 16,710.00 NO BID
Item No. 143 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 144 4,500.00 NO BID
Item No. 145 4,500.00 NO BID
Item No. 146 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 147 1,200.00 NO BID
Item No. 148 4,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 149 70,000.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 150 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 151 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 152 6,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 153 4,350.00 NO BID
Item No. 154 NO BID \ NO BID
17
Aggregate Bid Amount P e@%@b@eo " P 186,700.00
Form of Bid Security Bid Securing Declaration Bid Securing Declaration
Validity Period 120 days 120 days
Remarks Complying AN, Complying
GRAC%TE RICO (. TOMAS
ChairpeYson V{ce Chairperson
THEDA FLARE % QUILALA ROMMEL M. HERNANDEZ MENCHIE?@. ABELLAR
Member Member Member
JASPER A. YAUDER ELt Y T. TEOFILO
Member ember/ End-user
WINNIEFE‘}\ GU%ERREZ RYAN G. SIH
TWG on Financial&nd Legal Aspects TWG on Tecr‘nical Aspects
Chairperson Chairperson
Approved:

Dﬁ.sﬁmo E. VELASCO
% ) 7(éside‘ﬁt
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