.Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE FOR GOODS AND SERVICES
Romuio Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING THE LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE
BID AND RECOMMENDING THE AWARD OF CONTRACT

RESOLUTION NO. PB035-2022

BIDDING NO.: PURCHASE REQUEST NO. 2022-01-116

Category per RA9184: [ X ] GOODS []INFRA/WORKS [] CONSULTING
TITLE/DESCRIPTION: “SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF COLLEGE UNIFORMS”
APPROVED BUDGET FOR THE CONTRACT (ABC): P 10,360,000.00

WHEREAS, the TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY advertised the Invitation to Bid for
the project Supply and Delivery of College Uniforms with an Approved Budget for the
Contract (ABC) of ® 10,360,000.00 in the Philippine Government Electronic Procurement
System (PhilGEPS) and in conspicuous places in Tarlac State University on May 21,
2022;

WHEREAS, in response to the Invitation to Bid, five (5) prospective bidders
participated in the Pre-Bidding Conference held at Tarlac State University Business
Center Audio Visual Room (TSU-BC AVR) on May 31, 2022:

WHEREAS, in.the public bidding held at the TSU-BC AVR and webcasted via
Zoom on June 14, 2022, at 2:00 P.M.-

(@) three (3) bidders, namely, England Textiles, Zashen Fashions, and Zhujar
Manufacturing Incorporation, tendered their bids for the aforementioned
project,

(b) the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC), with the assistance of the Technical
Working Groups (TWGs), opened and checked the bids of the three bidders
and found the bids to be substantially complying with the eligibility, technical,
and financial requirements for the project as prescribed in the Bidding
Documents and were rated ‘passed”;

(c) the BAC resolved o declare England Textiles, as the bidder with the Lowest
Calculated Bid (LCB) for Lot 1 with the bid price of  4,850,000.00,

(d) the BAC resolved to declare and Zashen Fashions as the bidder with the
Single Calculated Bid (SCB) for Lot 2 with the bid price of P 2,574,400.00,

(e) the BAC resolved to declare Zashen Fashions as the bidder with the SCB for
Lot 3 with the bid price of # 2,839,360.00, and

(f) the BAC directed the TWGs to proceed with the Post-Qualification Evaluation
of the LCB and SCBs;

WHEREAS, in the Post-Qualification Evaluation Conference held via Zoom on
August 2, 2022:
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‘ (a) ihe TWG for Technical Aspect reported that the LCB for Lot 1 was responsive

to the technical requirements for the project as prescribed in the Bidding
Documents

(b) the TWG for Technical Aspect reported that the SCB for Lot 2 was responsive
to the technical requirements for the project as prescribed in the Bidding
Documents,

(c) the TWG for Technical Aspect reported that the SCB for Lot 3 was responsive
to the technical requirements for the project as prescribed in the Bidding
Documents,

(d) the TWG for Financial and Legal Aspects reported that the LCB for Lot 1 was
responsive to the legal and financial requirements for the project as prescribed
in the Bidding Documents,

(e) the TWG for Financial and Legal Aspects reported that upon the verification
and validation of the SCB for Lot 2, it was found that the Statement of Single
Largest Completed Contract (SLCC) claimed by the bidder was completed
beyond the contract period, and due to the delay, the bidder incurred liguidated
damages,

(f) the TWG for Financial and Legal Aspects reported that upon the verification
and validation of the SCB for Lot 3, it was found that the Statement of Single
Largest Completed Contract (SLCC) claimed by the bidder was completed
beyond the contract period, and due to the delay, the bidder incurred liquidated
damages,

(g) the BAC verified the reports of the TWGs, deliberated, and unanimously
agreed to adopt the reports of the TWGs finding the LCB for Lot 1 as
responsive,

(h) the BAC verified the reports of the TWGs, deliberated, and unanimously
agreed to declare the SCB for Lot 2 ag non-responsive and post-disqualified,

(i) the BAC verified the reports of the TWGs, deliberated, and unanimousiy
agreed to declare the SCB for Lot 3 as non-responsive and post-disqualified,
and

() the BAC directed the Secretariat to issue the Notice of Disqualification to
Zashen Fashions for Lot 2 and Lot 3 of the project Supply and Delivery of
College Uniforms:

THEREFORE, We, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby
RESOLVE, as it is hereby RESOLVED:

a) to declare the bid of England Textiles for Lot 1 of the project Supply and
Delivery of College Uniforms as the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid
(LCRB}) with the bid price of P 4,850,000.00,

b) to recommend to the President the award of the contract for Lot 1 of the project
Supply and Delivery of College Uniforms to England Textiles.

C) to declare a Failure of Bidding for Lot 2 and Lot 3 of the project Supply and
Delivery of College Uniforms.
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d) t;o direct the BAC Secretariat to post the re-bidding for Lot 2 and Lot 3 of the

project Supply and Delivery of College Uniforms.

RESOLVED, at TSU-BC AVR, thig 231 day of August, 2022.
{

/llL_/ /] o
MURPHY P. MOI{AMMED GHEROLD ¢. BENITEZ
Chairperson ice {jhalrperson
) | 4 é\_:
FAB RA PEDRO G. RTE FELIPE. JR.
P Mernber Member/End-User
Approved:
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Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS READ

Project Name: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF COLLEGE UNIFORMS

Project Location: TSU Main Campus, Tarlac State University Date: June 14, 2022
Implementing Office: Tarlac State University Time: 2:00 P.M.
Approved Budget for the Contract: # 10,360,000.00 Venue: BC-AVR
BIDDER England Textiles | Zhujar Mfg. Inc. Zashen
Fashions
Total Amount of | ™ 4,850,000.00 ™ 4,853,900.00 NO BID
Bid (Lot I)
Total Amount of NO BID NO BID P 2,574,400.00
Bid (Lot i)
Total Amount of NO BID NO BID P 2,839,360.00
Bid (Lot lil)
Form of Bid Bid Securing Bid Securing Bid Securing
Security Declaration Declaration Declaration
ot L 7 4
Validity Period 110 90 days 110 90 days 110 90 days
Remarks Complying Complying Complying

[

MURPH? P. MOHAMMED GHEROLINC. BENITEZ
Chairperson Vic aifperson

PEDRO G. ;iERTE FELIPE, JR.
ember/End-User

RYANG. SiH

TWG on Finan i: and Legal Aspects TWG on Techhical Aspects

Chdirperson Chairperson
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TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4430
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS CALCULATED

Project Name: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF COLLEGE UNIFORMS

Project Location: TSU Main Campus, Tarlac State University
Implementing Office: Tarlac State University
Approved Budget for the Contract: # 10,360,000.00

Date: June 14, 2022
Time: 2:00 P.M.
Venue: BC-AVR

BIDDER England Textiles | Zhujar Mfg. Inc. Zashen
Fashions
Total Amount of | ® 4,850,000.00 P 4,853,900.00 NO BID
Bid (Lot I)
Total Amount of NO BID NO BID P 2,574,400.00
Bid (Lot I1)
Total Amount of NO BID NO BID P 2,839,360.00
Bid (Lot i}
Form of Bid Bid Securing Bid Securing Bid Securing
Security Declaration Declaration Declaration
/ 41— P 4
Validity Period 20 90 days 110 80 days 120 90 days
Remarks Complying Complying Complying

M_IéYP_.M_O___ HAMMED

Chairperson

L
PEDROQO G. éRTE FELIPE, JR.
Member/End-User

: RYAN
TWG on Financi and Legal Aspects TWG on Tec
Chairperson Chair

G. SIH

erson




