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Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE FOR GOODS AND SERVICES
Romuio Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING THE LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE
BID (LCRB) AND RECOMMENDING THE AWARD OF CONTRACT

RESOLUTION NO. PB055-2023

BIDDING NO.: PURCHASE REQUEST NO. 2023-05-174
Category per RA9184. [X] GOODS [] INFRA/WORKS [] CONSULTING
TITLE/DESCRIPTION: “SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF STAGE AUDIO AND LIGHTING
EQUIPMENT AND BAND INSTRUMENTS”

- APPROVED BUDGET FOR THE CONTRACT (ABC): ¥ 3,797,600.00

WHEREAS, the TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY advertised the Invitation to Bid for
the project Supply and Delivery of Stage Audio and Lighting Equipment and Band
Instruments with an Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC) of # 3,797,600.00 in the
Philippine Government Electronic Procurement System (PhilGEPS) and in conspicuous
places in Tarlac State University on June 22, 2023;

WHEREAS, in response to the Invitation to Bid, three (3) prospective bidders
participated in the Pre-Bidding Conference held at Tarlac State University Business
Center Audio Visual Room (TSU-BC AVR) on June 29, 2023;

WHEREAS, in the public bidding held at the Business Center Audio Visual Room
(TSU-BC AVR) on July 11, 2023, at 2 P.M.:

(@) Four bidders, namely, Audio 4 Design & Technology Corp., Andsons
E_ducational Resources Inc., Mega Speechlab Enterprise, and All Visuals and
Lights. System tendered their bids.-for the aforementioned. project,

(b) the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC), with the assistance of the Technical
Working Groups (TWGS), opened and checked the first envelopes contained
in the bids submitted by the four bidders, using the non-discretionary “pass/fail”
criterion, and found the first envelopes of Audio 4 Design & Technology Corp.
A_ndsons Educationat Resources Inc., Mega Speechlaly Enterprise, and’ Ali'
Visuals and Lights System to contain all the required documents and were
rated “passed”.

(c) the BAC, with the assistance of the TWGs, evaluated and ranked the bids
_ , of
the four bidders-whose first envelopes were rated “passed’,

(d) th_e BAC resolved to declare Audio 4 Design & Technology Corp. as the bidder
:«gr; the Lowest Calculated Bid (LCB) for Lot No. 1 with the bid price of @
,336,000.00,

(e) to declare All- Visual & Lights System as the-bidder with the-Lowest Calculated:
Bid (LCB) for Lot No. 3 with the bid price of ® 984,928.00 ‘

(f) to declare a Failure of Bidding for Lot No. 2

(@) ::e Eé\g directed the TWGS to proceed with the post-qualification evaluation of
e S;
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WHEREAS, in the Post-Qualification Evaluation Conference held at the Business
Center Audio Visual Room (TSU-BC AVR) on September 5, 2023

(a) the TWG for the Legal and Financial Aspects reported that the LGB for Lot
o 1 and Lot No. 3 was responsive to the legal and financial requirements for
the project as prescribed in the Bidding Documents.

(b) the TWG for Technical Aspect reported that the LCB for Lot No. 1 and Lot No
3 was responsive to the technical requirements for the project as prescribed
in the Bidding Documents, and

(c) the BAC verified the repors of the TWGs, deliberated, and unanimously
agreed to declare the LCB for Lot No. 1 and Lot No. 3 as responsive.

~ THEREFORE, We, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby
RESOLVE, as it is hereby RESOLVED:

(@) to declare Audio 4 Design & Technology Coip. as the bidder with the Lowest
Calculated and Responsive Bid (LCRB) for Lot No. 1 with the bid price of P
1,336,000.00;

(b) to-declare All Visual & Lights System as the bidder with the Lowest Calculated
and Responsive Bid (LCRB) for Lot No. 3 with the bid price of ® 984,928.00
and

(c) 1o recommend to the President the Award of Contract for the project Supply
and Delivary of Stage Audio-and Lighting Equipment and Band Instruments-to
gudﬂo 4NDeSIQn & Technology Corp. for Lot Ng. 1 and All Visual & Lights System

r Lot No. 3.

RESOLVED. at TSU-BC AVR. this 5" day of September 2023,

MURPHY ¢ MOHAMMED ROLO/C. BENITEZ
Chairperson Vice-Chairperson

THEDA F’L'A;é G. QUILALA JASPER A, YAUDER

JHONEL £, PANLILIO

.Appm\‘r'ed:
|

DR. ARNOLD E.V%t?gsco
President
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Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Rormulo Bivd,, San Vicante, Tarac Cily
Tel. Na.: (045) 982-4630
websitarwww, isu.edi.ph

ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS CALCULATED

Project Name: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF STAGE AUDIO AND LIGHTING EQUIPMENT
AND BAND INSTRUMENTS

Project Location. Main Campus, Tartac State University Date: July 11, 2023
implementing Office: Tarlac State Univarsity. Time' 200 P M
Approved Budget for the Contract: # 3,797.600.00 Venue: BC-AVR
_ Audio 4 Design Andsons Mega All Visual &
BIDDER | & Technology | Educational Speechlab | Lights System
Corporation | Resources Inc. Enterprise
LotNo.1 | ®1336,000.00 | ®2146,121.00 |™2,130.500.00 |  1,838,568.00
Lot No. 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LotNo.3 | p 985,880.00 NO BID NO BID P 984,928.00
Form of : : . )

Bid Bld_Secufmg Bid Securing | Bid Securing Bid Securing
Security Declaration Declaration Declaration | Declaration
Validity | ‘

Period 120 days 120 days 120 days 120 days
R Tomplyi rrolvin N
emarks |  Complying Complying | Complying Complying
3
. MQHA D GHEROLD €, BENITEZ
Chairperson Vice Ghairperson
s— 1 -
THEDA FLARE'G. QUILALA

Member
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Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE FOR GOODS AND SERVICES
Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING THE LOWEST CALCULATED BID (LCB)
RESOLUTION NO. PB036-2023

BIDDING NO.: PURCHASE REQUEST NO. 2023-05-174
Category per RA9184: [ X ] GOODS [] INFRA/WORKS [] CONSULTING
TITLE/DESCRIPTION: “SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF STAGE AUDIO AND LIGHTING

EQUIPMENT AND BAND INSTRUMENTS”
APPROVED BUDGET FOR THE CONTRACT (ABC). P 3,797,600.00

WHEREAS, the TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY advertised the Invitation to Bid for
the project Supply and Delivery of Stage Audio and Lighting Equipment and Band
Instruments with an Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC) of # 3,797,600.00 in the
Philippine Government Electronic Procurement System (PhilGEPS) and in conspicuous
places in Tarlac State University on June 22, 2023;

WHEREAS, in response to the Invitation to Bid, three (3) prospective bidders
participated in the Pre-Bidding Conference held at Tarlac State University Business
Center Audio Visual Room (TSU-BC AVR) and webcasted via Zoom on June 29, 2023;

WHEREAS, in the public bidding held at the TSU-BC AVR on July 11, 2023, at
2:00 P.M., four (4) bidders, namely, Audio 4 Design & Technology Corp., Andsons
Educational Resources Inc., Mega Speechlab Enterprise, and All Visuals and Lights
System participated and tendered their bids for the aforementioned project;

_WHEREAS, the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC), with the assistance of
Technical Workmg Groups (TWGs), opened and checked the first envelopes con&iggg
in the bids submitted by the four bidders, using the non-discretionary “pass/fail” criterion
and fom_md that the first envelopes of Audio 4 Design & Technology Corp. Andsons'
Educational Resources Inc., Mega Speechlab Enterprise, and All Visuals énd Lights
System contained all the required documents and were rated “passed”;

WHEREAS, the BAC with the assistance of the TWG '
_ ) 1 S, proceeded wi
opening and evaluation of the second envelopes of the four bidderg and found ttl1t2t :2:

envelopes of the four bi i :
“passed”: bidders contained the prescribed documents and were rated

WHEREAS, the BAC with the assistance of th
/ ,  BA e TWGs, pro i
evaluation of the financial bids of the four bidders with the results asi‘.urfwen?ggge;v gglé?v?

Bidder
Audio 4 Design & Andsons
Lot . sl é;orp Educational Mega Spegchlab All Visual & Lights
No. ) BidFrics A ' Resources Inc. Enterprise System
id Price (As Bid Price (As 8id Price (As i i
Bid Pri
Calcu'l’ated), Rank | Calculated), | Rank | Calculated), | Rank CalcuI:?e(cgs Rank
» » s T

2,402,000.00 | 1,336,000.00 | 1 2,146121.00 | 4 |2130,500.00| 3 1,839,568.00 | 2

409,600.00 No Bid - No Bid - No Bid - No Bid

986,000.00 | 985,880.00 2 No Bid - No Bid

- 984,928.00 1
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NOW, THEREFORE, based on the foregoing findings, WE, the members of the

Bids and Awards Committee, hereby RESOLVE, as it is hereby RESOLVED:

() to declare Audio 4 Design & Technology Corp. as the bidder with the Lowest
Calculated Bid (LCB) for Lot No. 1 with the bid price of P 1,336,000.00.

(b) to declare All Visual & Lights System as the bidder with the Lawest Calculated
Bid (LCB) for Lot No. 3 with the bid price of P 984,828.00

(¢) to deciare a Failure of Bidding for Lot No. 2
(d) to direct the Technical Working Groups to proceed with the Post-Qualification

Evaluation of the LCBs and report their findings to the BAC within the
prescribed period

() To recommend to the President the procurement of Lot No. 2 of the project
Supply and Delivery of Stage Audio and Lighting Equipment and Band
Instruments using the appropriate alternative method of procurement in
accordance with the Implementing Rules and Regulations of R.A. 9184.

RESOLVED, at TSU-BC AVR, this 11" day of July 2023.

7

MURPHY P. MOHAMMED HEROLD @¢. BENIT
Chairperson Vice Irpersen
<
THEDA FLARE G. QUILALA SPER A-YAUDER
,  Member Member

JHONE 'Ié.;b NLILIO

Memﬂey -

Approved'

T
OR. Aﬂhﬂﬁs. VELASCO
PresideniA
Vs il gfj‘;

7

.

| Page 20fZ
BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING THE LOWEST CALCULATED BID {LCB)

RESOLUTION NO. PB036-2023

-_‘___'_—_—-——————




