Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE FOR INFRASTRUCTURES
Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING THE LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE
BID (LCRB)/ SINGLE CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BID (SCRB) AND
RECOMMENDING THE AWARD OF CONTRACT

RESOLUTION NO. PB020-2024

BIDDING NO.: PURCHASE REQUEST NO. 2023-12-487

Category per RA9184: [X] GOODS [] INFRA/WORKS [] CONSULTING
TITLE/DESCRIPTION: “SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF LABORATORY CHEMICALS
AND REAGENTS (APP 2023), REBID”

APPROVED BUDGET FOR THE CONTRACT (ABC): P 1,725,999.55

WHEREAS, the TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY advertised the Invitation to Bid for
the project Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Chemicals and Reagents (APP 2023),
Rebid with an Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC) of P 1,725,999.55 in the Philippine
Government Electronic Procurement System (PhilGEPS) and in conspicuous places in
Tarlac State University on January 18, 2024;

WHEREAS, in response to the Invitation to Bid, one (1) prospective bidder
participated in the Pre-Bidding Conference held at Tarlac State University Business
Center Audio Visual Room (TSU-BC AVR) and webcasted via Zoom on January 18, 2024:

WHEREAS, in the public bidding held at the Business Center Audio Visual Room
(TSU-BC AVR) on February 7, 2024, at 2:00 P.M.:

(a) Two bidders, namely, Glenwood Technologies International Inc. and Mt. Zion
Scientific Inc. tendered their bids for the aforementioned project,

(b) the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC), with the assistance of the Technical
Working Groups (TWGs), opened and checked the first envelopes contained
in the bids submitted by the two bidders, using the non-discretionary “pass/fail”
criterion, and found the first envelopes of Glenwood Technologies International
Inc. and Mt. Zion Scientific Inc. to contain all the required documents and were
rated “passed”.

(c) the BAC, with the assistance of the TWGs, evaluated and ranked the bids of
the two bidders whose first envelopes were rated “passed”,

(d) the BAC resolved to declare Glenwood Technologies International Inc., as the
bidder with the Lowest Calculated Bid (LCB)/ Single Calculated Bid (SCB) with
an aggregate amount of # 207,818.80 for the following item numbers.

Item No. 19 with the bid price of P 7,249.54,
Item No. 49 with the bid price of # 3,390.91,
Iltem No. 51 with the bid price of ® 4, 677.12,
Item No. 55 with the bid price of P 4,443.26,
Item No. 58 with the bid price of  3,040.13,
Item No. 59 with the bid price of P 4,092.48,
Item No. 60 with the bid price of P 4,443.26,
Item No. 65 with the bid price of # 19,877.75,
Item No. 66 with the bid price of P 5,846.40,
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Item No
Item No
Item No
Item No
Item No
ltem No
Item No
Iltem No
Item No
Item No
Iltem No
Item No

Item No.
Iltem No.
Iltem No.
Iltem No.
Item No.
Item No.
Iltem No.
Iltem No.
ltem No.
Item No.
Item No.
Item No.
Item No.
Item No.
Iltem No.
Item No.
Item No.
Item No.
Iltem No.

. 67 with the bid price of P 4,677.12,

. 75 with the bid price of P 4,092.48,

. 80 with the bid price of P 7,249.54,

. 81 with the bid price of P 7,249.54,

. 85 with the bid price of P 3,624.77,

. 86 with the bid price of # 2,455.49,

. 91 with the bid price of P 3,975.55;

. 100 with the bid price of P 3,858.62,
. 101 with the bid price of # 1,870.85,
. 103 with the bid price of # 3,390.91,
. 104 with the bid price of # 3,040.13,
. 105 with the bid price of  4,092.48,
106 with the bid price of P 4,443.26,
107 with the bid price of # 2,923.20,
108 with the bid price of ® 4,677.12,
109 with the bid price of ® 3,624.77,
110 with the bid price of P 3,624.77,
112 with the bid price of P 3,624.77,
113 with the bid price of P 2,455.49,
114 with the bid price of ® 3,975.55,
116 with the bid price of # 7,033.28,
117 with the bid price of P 3,858.62,
118 with the bid price of # 1,870.85,
119 with the bid price of # 3,390.91,

129 with the bid price of ® 1,403.14,
130 with the bid price of ® 1,403.14,

134 with the bid price of P 8,886.52,
136 with the bid price of P 5,612.54,

120 with the bid price of P 12,277 .44,

133 with the bid price of ® 11,458.94,

151 with the bid price of ® 14,636.16,

(e) to declare Mt. Zion Scientific Inc., as the bidder with the Lowest Calculated Bid
(LCB) / Single Calculated Bid (SCB) with an aggregate amount of P 332,449.00
for the following item numbers.

Item No. 1 with the bid price of £ 9,252.00,

ltem No.
Iltem No.
Item No.
ltem No.
Iltem No.

Item No.

Item No.
Item No.
Item No.

Item No.

Item No.

Item No.
Item No.
Item No.

Item No.

Iltem No.
Item No.
Item No.
Item No.
Iltem No.

3 with the bid price of # 9,252.00,
12 with the bid price of # 3,200.00,
18 with the bid price of  4,700.00,
22 with the bid price of  4,000.00,
23 with the bid price of # 35,000.00,
28 with the bid price of 2 7,000.00,
29 with the bid price of # 3,000.00,
31 with the bid price of # 3,000.00,
33 with the bid price of # 3,930.00,
34 with the bid price of # 4,500.00,
35 with the bid price of # 8,000.00,
36 with the bid price of # 9,800.00,
38 with the bid price of  7,680.00,
39 with the bid price of £ 20,000.00,
40 with the bid price of # 14,000.00,
44 with the bid price of £ 6,000.00,
54 with the bid price of # 3,625.00,
56 with the bid price of # 6,000.00,
61 with the bid price of # 2,000.00,
62 with the bid price of # 10,000.00,
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Item No. 71 with the bid price of # 22,000.00,
Item No. 72 with the bid price of  16,500.00,
Item No. 88 with the bid price of £ 8,000.00,
Iltem No. 92 with the bid price of £ 8,900.00,
Iltem No. 94 with the bid price of £ 3,000.00,
Iltem No. 95 with the bid price of # 3,000.00,
Iltem No. 96 with the bid price of # 3,000.00,
Item No. 98 with the bid price of # 31,200.00,
Iltem No. 121 with the bid price of  15,000.00,
Item No. 137 with the bid price of # 2,800.00,
Item No. 138 with the bid price of  2,800.00,
Iltem No. 139 with the bid price of # 6,800.00,
Iltem No. 142 with the bid price of # 8,000.00,
Iltem No. 145 with the bid price of # 1,500.00,
Item No. 152 with the bid price of # 2,000.00,
Item No. 153 with the bid price of  3,960.00,
Item No. 154 with the bid price of # 13,050.00,
Item No. 157 with the bid price of # 7,000.00,

(f) the BAC directed the TWGs to proceed with the post-qualification evaluation of
the LCB and SCB;

(9) to declare a Failure of Bidding for Item Nos.10, 45, 73, 127 and 141 bids
exceeded the allotted budget and,

(h) to declare a Failure of Bidding for Item Nos. 2, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 11, 13, 14, 15,
16, 17, 20, 21, 24, 25, 26, 27, 30, 32, 37, 41, 42, 43, 46, 47, 48, 50, 52, 53, 57,
63, 64, 68, 69, 70, 74, 76, 77, 78, 79, 82, 83, 84, 87, 89, 90, 93, 97, 99, 102,
111, 115, 122, 123, 124, 125, 126, 128, 131, 132, 135, 140, 143, 144, 146,
147, 148, 149, 150, 155, 156, 158, 159, 160, 161, 162, 163, 164 and 165 no
bid was received,

(1) to direct the BAC Secretariat to post the re-bidding for Item Nos. 2, 4, 5, 6, 7,
8, 9, 10, 11, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 20, 21, 24, 25, 26, 27, 30, 32, 37, 41, 42, 43,
45, 46, 47, 48, 50, 52, 53, 57, 63, 64, 68, 69, 70, 73, 74, 76, 77, 78, 79, 82, 83,
84, 87, 89, 90, 93, 97, 99, 102, 111, 115, 122, 123, 124, 125, 126, 127, 128,
131, 132, 135, 140, 141, 143, 144, 146, 147, 148, 149, 150, 155, 156, 158,
159, 160, 161, 162, 163, 164 and 165 of the project Supply and Delivery of
Laboratory Chemicals and Reagents (APP 2023), Rebid in accordance with
Section 35.3 of the IRR of R. A. 9184.

WHEREAS, in the Post-Qualification Evaluation Conference held at the Business
Center Audio Visual Room (TSU-BC AVR) on March 22, 2024:

(a) the TWG for the Legal and Financial Aspects reported that the LCB and SCB
was responsive to the legal and financial requirements for the project as
prescribed in the Bidding Documents,

(b) the TWG for Technical Aspect reported that the LCB and SCB was responsive
to the technical requirements for the project as prescribed in the Bidding
Documents, and

(c) the BAC verified the reports of the TWGs, deliberated, and unanimously
agreed to declare the LCB and SCB as responsive;
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THEREFORE, We, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby
RESOLVE, as it is hereby RESOLVED:

(a) to declare Glenwood Technologies International Inc., as the bidder with the
Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid (LCRB)/ Single Calculated and
Responsive Bid (SCB) with an aggregate amount of # 207,818.80 for the
following item numbers.

Item No. 19 with the bid price of # 7,249.54,
Item No. 49 with the bid price of # 3,390.91,
Item No. 51 with the bid price of P 4, 677.12,
Item No. 55 with the bid price of P 4,443.26,
Item No. 58 with the bid price of  3,040.13,
Iltem No. 59 with the bid price of P 4,092.48,
Item No. 60 with the bid price of ® 4,443.26,
Item No. 65 with the bid price of  19,877.75,
Item No. 66 with the bid price of # 5,846.40,
Item No. 67 with the bid price of # 4,677.12,
Item No. 75 with the bid price of ® 4,092.48,
Item No. 80 with the bid price of  7,249.54,
Item No. 81 with the bid price of ® 7,249.54,
Item No. 85 with the bid price of P 3,624.77,
Item No. 86 with the bid price of P 2,455.49,
Item No. 91 with the bid price of P 3,975.55;
Item No. 100 with the bid price of P 3,858.62,
Item No. 101 with the bid price of ® 1,870.85,
Item No. 103 with the bid price of # 3,390.91,
Item No. 104 with the bid price of  3,040.13,
Item No. 105 with the bid price of P 4,092.48,
Item No. 106 with the bid price of P 4,443.26,
Item No. 107 with the bid price of P 2,923.20,
Item No. 108 with the bid price of  4,677.12,
Item No. 109 with the bid price of P 3,624.77,
Item No. 110 with the bid price of  3,624.77,
Item No. 112 with the bid price of ® 3,624.77,
Iltem No. 113 with the bid price of P 2,455.49,
Iltem No. 114 with the bid price of ® 3,975.55,
Iltem No. 116 with the bid price of # 7,033.28,
Item No. 117 with the bid price of P 3,858.62,
Item No. 118 with the bid price of # 1,870.85,
Item No. 119 with the bid price of # 3,390.91,
Item No. 120 with the bid price of P 12,277.44,
Item No. 129 with the bid price of ® 1,403.14,
Iltem No. 130 with the bid price of ® 1,403.14,
Iltem No. 133 with the bid price of ® 11,458.94,
Iltem No. 134 with the bid price of  8,886.52,
Iltem No. 136 with the bid price of @ 5,612.54,
Item No. 151 with the bid price of ® 14,636.16,

(b) to declare Mt. Zion Scientific Inc., as the bidder with the Lowest Calculated and
Responsive Bid (LCRB) / Single Calculated and Responsive Bid (SCRB) with
an aggregate amount of # 332,449.00 for the following item numbers.

Item No. 1 with the bid price of # 9,252.00,
Item No. 3 with the bid price of # 9,252.00,
Item No. 12 with the bid price of £ 3,200.00,

Page 4 of 6

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING THE LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BID (LCRB) AND
RECOMMENDING THE AWARD OF CONTRACT

RESOLUTION NO. PB020-2024




item No. 18 with the bid price of # 4,700.00,
Item No. 22 with the bid price of  4,000.00,
Item No. 23 with the bid price of # 35,000.00,
Item No. 28 with the bid price of # 7,000.00,
Item No. 29 with the bid price of # 3,000.00,
Item No. 31 with the bid price of # 3,000.00,
Item No. 33 with the bid price of P 3,930.00,
Item No. 34 with the bid price of  4,500.00,
Item No. 35 with the bid price of # 8,000.00,
Item No. 36 with the bid price of # 9,800.00,
ltem No. 38 with the bid price of £ 7,680.00,
Item No. 39 with the bid price of # 20,000.00,
Item No. 40 with the bid price of P 14,000.00,
Item No. 44 with the bid price of  6,000.00,
Item No. 54 with the bid price of  3,625.00,
Item No. 56 with the bid price of £ 6,000.00,
Item No. 61 with the bid price of £ 2,000.00,
Item No. 62 with the bid price of # 10,000.00,
Item No. 71 with the bid price of £ 22,000.00,
Item No. 72 with the bid price of # 16,500.00,
Item No. 88 with the bid price of # 8,000.00,
Item No. 92 with the bid price of  8,900.00,
Item No. 94 with the bid price of  3,000.00,
Item No. 95 with the bid price of # 3,000.00,
Item No. 96 with the bid price of  3,000.00,
Item No. 98 with the bid price of # 31,200.00,
Item No. 121 with the bid price of # 15,000.00,
Item No. 137 with the bid price of # 2,800.00,
Item No. 138 with the bid price of # 2,800.00,
Item No. 139 with the bid price of # 6,800.00,
Item No. 142 with the bid price of # 8,000.00,
Item No. 145 with the bid price of £ 1,500.00,
Item No. 152 with the bid price of  2,000.00,
Iltem No. 153 with the bid price of # 3,960.00,
Item No. 154 with the bid price of  13,050.00,
Item No. 157 with the bid price of # 7,000.00,

(c) to recommend to the President the Award of Contract for the project Supply
and Delivery of Laboratory Chemicals and Reagents (APP 2023), Rebid to
Glenwood Technologies International Inc. for item nos. 19, 49, 51, 55, 58, 59,
60, 65, 66, 67, 75, 80, 81, 85, 86, 91, 100, 101, 103, 104, 105, 106, 107, 108,
109, 110, 112, 113, 114, 116, 117, 118, 119, 120, 129, 130, 133, 134, 136 and
151.

(d) to recommend to the President the Award of Contract for the project Supply
and Delivery of Laboratory Chemicals and Reagents (APP 2023), Rebid to Mt.
Zion Scientific Inc. for item nos. 1, 3, 12, 18, 22, 23, 28, 29, 31, 33, 34, 35, 36,
38, 39, 40, 44, 54, 56, 61, 62, 71, 72, 88, 92, 94, 95, 96, 98, 121, 137, 138,
139, 142, 145, 152, 153, 154 and 157.

RESOLVED, at TSU-BC AVR, this 22" day of Marc 024.

MURPHY lé MOHAMMED

Chairperson
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THEDA FLARE G. QUILALA JASP
Member

Mem'ber

Approved:
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Republic of the Philippines

TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City

Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

Project Name: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF LABORATORY CHEMICALS AND REAGENTS

(APP 2023)

ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS READ

Project Location: Main Campus, Tarlac State University
Implementing Office: Tarlac State University
Approved Budget for the Contract: ® 1,725,999.55

Date: February 7, 2024
Time: 2:00 P.M.
Venue: BC-AVR

GLENWOOD
BIDDER MT. ZION SCIENTIFIC INC. TECHNOLOGIES
INTERNATIONAL INC.

Item No. 1 9,252.00 NO BID
Item No. 2 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 3 9,252.00 NO BID
Item No. 4 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 5 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 6 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 7 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 8

NO BID NO BID
Item No. 9

NO BID NO BID
Item No. 10

7,960.00 NO BID
Item No. 11

NO BID NO BID
Item No. 12

3,200.00 NO BID
Item No. 13

NO BID NO BID




Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

Item No. 14
NO BID NO BID
Item No. 15
NO BID NO BID
item No. 16
NO BID NO BID
Item No. 17
NO BID NO BID
Item No. 18
4,700.00 NO BID
Item No. 19
NO BID 7,249.54
Item No. 20
NO BID NO BID
Item No. 21
NO BID NO BID
Item No. 22
4,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 23
35,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 24
NO BID NO BID
Item No. 25
NO BID NO BID
Item No. 26 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 27 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 28 7,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 29 3,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 30 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 31 3,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 32 NO BID NO BID




Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

Item No. 33 3,930.00 NO BID
Item No. 34 4,500.00 NO BID
Item No. 35 8,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 36 9,800.00 NO BID
Item No. 37 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 38 7,680.00 NO BID
Item No. 39 20,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 40 14,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 41 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 42 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 43 NQO BID NO BID
Iitem No. 44 6,000.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 45 NO BID 8,184.96
Item No. 46 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 47 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 48 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 49 5,800.00 3,390.91
Item No. 50 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 51 NO BID 4,677.12




Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

Item No. 52 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 53 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 54 3,625.00 NO BID
Item No. 55 NO BID 4,443.26
Item No. 56 6,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 57 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 58 5,890.00 3,040.13
Item No. 59 7,600.00 4,092.48
Item No. 60 8,250.00 4,443.26
Item No. 61 2,000.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 62 10,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 63 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 64 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 65 32,400.00 19,877.75
Item No. 66 15,000.00 5,846.40
Item No. 67 NO BID 4,677.12
Item No. 68 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 69 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 70 NO BID NO BID




Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

Item No. 71 22,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 72 16,500.00 NO BID
Item No. 73 9,000.00 NO BID
item No. 74 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 75 8,500.00 4,092.48
Item No. 76 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 77 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 78 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 79 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 80 18,400.00 7,249.54
Item No. 81 13,740.00 7,249.54
Item No. 82 NO BID NO BID
item No. 83 NO BIiD NO BiD
Iitem No. 84 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 85 5,800.00 3,624.77
Item No. 86 4,900.00 2,455.49
Item No. 87 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 88 8,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 89 NO BID NO BID




Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

Item No. 90 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 91 26,400.00 3,975.55
Item No. 92 8,900.00 NO BID
item No. 93 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 94 3,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 95 3,000.00 NO BID
item No. 96 3,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 97 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 98 31,200.00 NO BID
Item No. 99 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 100 5,800.00 3,858.62
Item No. 101 5,700.00 1,870.85
Item No. 102 NO BID NG BID
Item No. 103 5,800.00 3,390.91
Item No. 104 5,900.00 3,040.13
Item No. 105 7,500.00 4,092.48
item No. 106 8,600.00 4,443.26
Item No. 107 7,480.00 2,923.20
Item No. 108 NO BID 4,677.12




Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

Item No. 109 7,400.00 3,624.77
Item No. 110 6,800.00 3,624.77
Item No. 111 NO BID NO BID
item No. 112 5,700.00 3,624.77
Item No. 113 4,600.00 2,455.49
Item No. 114 8,230.00 3,975.55
Item No. 115 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 116 NO BID 7,033.28
Item No. 117 5,800.00 3,858.62
Item No. 118 5,820.00 1,870.85
Item No. 119 6,490.00 3,390.91
Item No. 120 28,200.00 12,277.44
item No. 121 15,000.00 24,554.90
Item No. 122 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 123 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 124 NO BID NO BID
item No. 125 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 126 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 127 1,600.00 NO BID




Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

Item No. 128 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 129 NO BID 1,403.14
Item No. 130 NO BID 1,403.14
item No. 131 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 132 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 133 22,000.00 11,458.94
Item No. 134 26,000.00 8,886.52
Item No. 135 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 136 NO BID 5,612.54
Item No. 137 2,800.00 NO BID
Item No. 138 2,800.00 NO BID
Item No. 139 6,800.00 NO BID
item No. 140 NO BID NO BID
Iitem No. 141 7,600.00 NO BID
Item No. 142 8,000.00 NO BID
Iitem No. 143 NO BID NO BID
item No. 144 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 145 1,500.00 NO BID
Item No. 146 NO BID NO BID




Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
| Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
| Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

|

] Item No. 147 NO BID NO BID

|

H Item No. 148 NO BID NO BID

|
Item No. 149 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 150 NO BID NO BID

1 Item No. 151 NO BID 14,636.16

‘

3 Item No. 152 2,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 153 3,960.00 NO BID

|

\ Item No. 154 13,050.00 NO BID

|

} Item No. 155 NO BID NO BID

|

| Item No. 156 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 157 7,000.00 NO BID

| Item No. 158 NO BID NO BID

:\‘

‘ item No. 159 NO BiD NO BID

1 Item No. 160 NO BID NO BID

4

| Item No. 161 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 162 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 163 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 164 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 165 NO BID NO BID

]



P,

Republic of the Philippines

TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City

Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

Form of Bid : : : . . .
Security Bid Securing Declaration Bid Securing Declaration
Validity Period 120 days 120 days
Remarks Complying Complying
MURPHY P. MOHAMMED
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Republic of the Philippines

TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City

Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS CALCULATED

Project Name: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF LABORATORY CHEMICALS AND REAGENTS

(APP 2023)

Project Location: Main Campus, Tarlac State University
Implementing Office: Tarlac State University
Approved Budget for the Contract: ® 1,725,999.55

Date: February 7, 2024
Time: 2:00 P.M.
Venue: BC-AVR

GLENWOOD
BIDDER MT. ZION SCIENTIFIC INC. TECHNOLOGIES
INTERNATIONAL INC.

Item No. 1 9,252.00 NO BID
Item No. 2 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 3 9,252.00 NO BID
Item No. 4 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 5 NO BID NO BID
item No. 6 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 7 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 8

NO BID NO BID
Item No. 9

NO BID NO BID
Item No. 10

7,960.00 NO BID
Item No. 11

NO BID NO BID
Item No. 12

3,200.00 NO BID
Item No. 13

NO BID NO BID
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TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
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Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

Item No. 14
NO BID NO BID

Item No. 15
NO BID NO BID

Item No. 16
NO BID NO BID

Item No. 17
NO BID NO BID

Item No. 18
4,700.00 NO BID

Item No. 19
NO BID 7,249.54

item No. 20
NO BID NO BID

item No. 21
NO BID NO BID

Item No. 22
4,000.00 NO BID

Item No. 23
35,000.00 NO BID

Item No. 24
NO BID NO BID

Item No. 25
NO BID NO BID
Item No. 26 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 27 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 28 7,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 29 3,000.00 NO BID
item No. 30 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 31 3,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 32 NO BID NO BID
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Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
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Item No. 33 3,930.00 NO BID
Item No. 34 4,500.00 NO BID
Item No. 35 8,000.00 NO BID
item No. 36 9,800.00 NO BID
Item No. 37 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 38 7,680.00 NO BID
Item No. 39 20,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 40 14,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 41 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 42 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 43 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 44 6,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 45 NO BIiD 8,184.96
Item No. 46 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 47 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 48 NO BID NO BID
item No. 49 5,800.00 3,390.91
Item No. 50 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 51 NO BID 4,677.12
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item No. 52 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 53 NO BID NO BID
Iitem No. 54 3,625.00 NO BID
Item No. 55 NO BID 4,443.26
item No. 56 6,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 57 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 58 5,890.00 3,040.13
Item No. 59 7,600.00 4,092.48
Item No. 60 8,250.00 4,443.26
Item No. 61 2,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 62 10,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 63 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 64 NGO BIiD NO BIiD
Item No. 65 32,400.00 19,877.75
Item No. 66 15,000.00 5,846.40
Item No. 67 NO BID 4,677.12
Item No. 68 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 69 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 70 NO BID NO BID
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Item No. 71 22,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 72 16,500.00 NO BID
Item No. 73 9,000.00 NO BID
item No. 74 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 75 8,500.00 4,560.19
Item No. 76 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 77 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 78 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 79 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 80 18,400.00 7,249.54
Item No. 81 13,740.00 7,249.54
Item No. 82 NO BID NO BID
item No. 83 NO BID NO BID
Iitem No. 84 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 85 5,800.00 3,624.77
Item No. 86 4,900.00 2,455.49
item No. 87 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 88 8,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 89 NO BID NO BID
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Item No. 90 NO BID NO BID

Item No. 91 26,400.00 11,926.65
Item No. 92 8,900.00 NO BID

Item No. 93 NO BID NO BID

Item No. 94 3,000.00 NO BID

Item No. 95 3,000.00 NO BID

Item No. 96 3,000.00 NO BID

Item No. 97 NO BID NO BID

Item No. 98 31,200.00 NO BID

Item No. 99 NO BID NO BID

Item No. 100 5,800.00 3,858.62
Item No. 101 5,700.00 1,870.85
Iitem No. 102 NO BID NO BID

Item No. 103 5,800.00 3,390.91

Item No. 104 5,900.00 3,040.13
Item No. 105 7,500.00 4,092.48
item No. 106 8,600.00 4,443.26
Item No. 107 7,480.00 2,923.20

Item No. 108 NO BID 4,677.12
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Item No. 109 7,400.00 3,624.77
Item No. 110 6,800.00 3,624.77
Item No. 111 NO BID NO BID
item No. 112 5,700.00 3,975.55
Item No. 113 4,600.00 2,455.49
Item No. 114 8,230.00 3,975.55
Item No. 115 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 116 NO BID 7,033.28
Item No. 117 5,800.00 3,858.62
Item No. 118 5,820.00 1,870.85
Item No. 119 6,490.00 3,390.91
Iitem No. 120 28,200.00 12,277.44
Iitem No. 121 15,0600.00 24,554.90
Item No. 122 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 123 NO BID NO BID
item No. 124 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 125 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 126 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 127 1,600.00 NO BID
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Item No. 128 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 129 NO BID 7,015.70
Item No. 130 NO BID 7,015.70
item No. 131 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 132 NO BID NO BID
Iitem No. 133 22,000.00 11,458.94
Item No. 134 26,000.00 8,886.52
Item No. 135 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 136 NO BID 22,450.00
Item No. 137 2,800.00 NO BID
Item No. 138 2,800.00 NO BID
Item No. 139 6,800.00 NO BID
item No. 140 NO BID NO BID
Iitem No. 141 7,600.00 NO BID
Item No. 142 8,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 143 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 144 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 145 1,500.00 NO BID
Item No. 146 NO BID NO BID
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Item No. 147 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 148 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 149 NO BID NO BID
item No. 150 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 151 NO BID 29,272.32
Item No. 152 2,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 153 3,960.00 NO BID
Iltem No. 154 13,050.00 NO BID
Item No. 155 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 156 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 157 7,000.00 NO BID
Item No. 158 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 159 NG BID NG BID
Item No. 160 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 161 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 162 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 163 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 164 NO BID NO BID
Item No. 165 NO BID NO BID
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Form of Bid , . . . . .
Security Bid Securing Declaration Bid Securing Declaration
Validity Period 120 days 120 days
Remarks Complying Complying

MURPHY P. MOHAMMED

Chairperson

THEDA FLARE G.

Member

ELE Y T. TEOFILO
Member/End-user

. QUILALA JASPER-AYAUDER
Member

RYANAQ SIH

Approved:

E. VELASCO
resident

TWG on Tecj‘enical Aspects
Chair

rson
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Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE FOR GOODS AND SERVICES
Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING THE LOWEST CALCULATED BID (LCB)/ SINGLE
CALCULATED BID (SCB)

RESOLUTION NO. PB014-2024

BIDDING NO.: PURCHASE REQUEST NO. 2023-12-487

Category per RA9184: [ X ] GOODS [ ] INFRA/WORKS [] CONSULTING
TITLE/DESCRIPTION: “SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF LABORATORY CHEMICALS
AND REAGENTS (APP 2023), REBID”

APPROVED BUDGET FOR THE CONTRACT (ABC): P 1,725,999.55

WHEREAS, the TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY advertised the Invitation to Bid for
the project Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Chemicals and Reagents (APP 2023),
Rebid with an Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC) of  1,725,999.55 in the Philippine
Government Electronic Procurement System (PhilGEPS) and in conspicuous places in
Tarlac State University on January 18, 2024;

WHEREAS, in response to the Invitation to Bid, one (1) prospective bidders
participated in the Pre-Bidding Conference held at Tarlac State University Business
Center Audio Visual Room (TSU-BC AVR) and webcasted via Zoom on January 18, 2024;

WHEREAS, in the public bidding held at the TSU-BC AVR on February 7, 2024,
at 2:.00 P.M., two (2) bidders, namely, Glenwood Technologies International Inc. and Mt.
Zion Scientific Inc. participated and tendered their bids for the aforementioned project;

| WHEREAS, the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC), with the assistance of the
| Technical Working Groups (TWGs), opened and checked the first envelopes contained
in the bids submitted by the two bidders, using the non-discretionary “pass/fail” criterion,
and found that the first envelopes of Glenwood Technologies International Inc. and Mt.
Zion Scientific Inc. contained all the required documents and were rated “passed”;

WHEREAS, the BAC with the assistance of the TWGs, proceeded with the
opening and evaluation of the second envelopes of the two bidders and found that the
envelopes of the two bidders contained the prescribed documents and were rated
“passed”;

WHEREAS, the BAC with the assistance of the TWGs, proceeded with the
evaluation of the financial bids of the two bidders with the results as summarized below:

Bidder
Iﬁ? AEE G'e'l‘r‘ft’gfr?aggﬁgmggies Mt. Zion Scientific Inc.
Catcuiated) P | RO | Caloularech p | Rank
1 B NO BID . 9,252.00 1
2 — NO BID ] NO BID :
3 13.440.00 NO BID - 9,252.00
4 5,560.60 NO BID - NO BID -
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| ? 4,000.00 NO BID ] NOBID ]
i £ 8,000.00 NG BID ] :Z :E
‘ 4,000.00 NO BID
l 8 4,000.00 NO BID ] el -
? 8,000.00 NO BID - R _
10 4,560, NO BID - 7,960.00 '
11 . NO BID - NO BID .
12 I NO BID - 3,200.00 1
l 1 4,000.00 NOBID ) kel _
14 2,000.00 NOBID - NOBID )
1 e 6,000.00 NOBID ] NOBID _
18 4,000.00 NO BID — e ]
17 8,000.00 NOBID ] i ]
18 4.803.60 NO BID ) 4,700.00 1
19 ShEaaD 7,249.54 1 NOBID -
22 3,000.00 NO BID - NI ]
ok 6,000.00 NOBID - i )
22 4.000.00 NO BID ) 4,000.00 1
23 55 650,00 NO BID : 35,000.00 1
4 16,000.00 NO BID _ o ]
<b 21,250.00 NOBID _ NOBID ]
25 43,750.00 NOBID ] NOBID -
= 6,000.00 NO BID _ NOBID _
28 7.000.00 NO BID i 7,000.00 1
29 o 5306 NO BID - 3,000.00 1
30 1.000.00 NO BID i NO BID -
31 3.000.00 NO BID - 3,000.00 1
32 S NO BID - NO BID .
33 — NO BID ] 3,930.00 1
34 I NO BID - 4,500.00 1
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35 — NO BID 8,000.00 1
36 10.000.00 NO BID 9,800.00 1
37 o NO BID NO BID i
38 5.000.00 NO BID 7,680.00 1
39 . NO BID 20,000.00 1
40 14,000.00 NO BID 14,000.00 1
4 6,000.00 NG BID NOBID ]
42 18,000.00 NO BID REES ]
g 16,000.00 NG BID NOBID ]
44 6,000.00 NO BID 6,000.00 :
45 A 8,184.96 NOBID -
o 6,000.00 NO BID NOBID -
il 6,000.00 NO BID NOBID ]
48 6,000.00 NO BID NOBID _
49 — 3,390.91 5,800.00 2
i 10,000.00 NO BID NOBID )
51 SR 4,677.12 et Bk ]
52 8,000.00 NO BID NOBID -
58 11,000.00 N BID et -
54 - NO BID 3,625.00 1
55 e 4,443.26 NO BID i
56 6.166,00 NO BID 6,000.00 1
57 4.008.60 NO BID NO BID -
58 — 3,040.13 5,890.00 2
59 —— 4,092.48 7,600.00 2
60 R 4,443.26 8,250.00 2
61 2.000.00 NO BID 2,000.00 1
62 15,000.08 NO BID 10,000.00 1
B 2,000.00 N B NOBID ]
o 4,000.00 s L e ]
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65 43 530,05 19,877.75 32,400.00 2
66 o 5,846.40 15,000.00 2
67 — 4,677.12 NG BID .
o 3,000.00 NO BID NS _
> 4,000.00 NO BID NOBID ]
4 6,000.00 NO BID NOBID -
71 — NO BID 22,000.00 1
72 I NO BID 16,500.00 1
73 . NO BID 9,000.00 .
74 B0 NO BID NO BID .
75 8,630, 4,560.19 ©8,500.00 2
L 4,000.00 NO BID sl ]
7 10,000.00 NO BID NOBID ]
i 4,000.00 NO BID NOBID ]
8 36,999.93 NO BID S ]
80 T 7,249.54 18,400.00 2
81 —— 7,249.54 13,740.00 2
- 3,000.00 NO BID NO B ]
82 6,000.00 NOBID ity _
£ 3,000.00 NO BID NOBID ]
85 6 G 3,624.77 5,800.00 2
86 —_ 2,455.49 4,900.00 2
87 6.000.00 NO BID NO BID :
88 6 30605 NO BID 8,000.00 1
#e 4,000.00 NO BID NOBID -
Su 2,000.00 NO BID e EE _
91 26.550.00 11,926.65 26,400.00 2
92 P NO BID 8,900.00 1
93 BTG NO BID NO BID :
94 3100000 NO BID 3,000.00 :
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95 4,423 80 NO BID 3,000.00 1
9 o B NO BID 3,000.00 1
o7 4« O NO BID NO BID i
98 R NO BID 31,200.00 1
99 400000 NO BID NO BID .
100 G 3,858.62 5,800.00 2
101 R 1,870.85 5,700.00 2
0% | o NO BID NO BID :
103 . 3,390.91 5,800.00 2
104 g i) 3,040.13 5,900.00 2
105 R 4,092.48 7,500.00 2
106 — 4,443.26 8,600.00 2
107 I 2,923.20 7,480.00 2
108 ST 4,677.12 NO BID .
08 | 4000000 3,624.77 7,400.00 2
110 7100000 3,624.77 6,800.00 2
111 o NO BID NO BID ‘
112 & FaB 3,624.77 5,700.00 2
113 — 2,455.49 4,600.00 2
114 6,000.00 3,975.55 8,230.00 2
115 5 60,80 NO BID NO BID :
18 | 5 50508 7,033.28 NO BID .
117 I 3,858.62 5,800.00 2
118 I 1,870.85 5,820.00 2
119 7 A 3,390.91 6,490.00 2
120 | e 12,277.44 28,200.00 2
121 — 24,554.90 15,000.00 1
122 550000 NO BID NOBID :
123 — NO BID NO BID ]
1= 42,530.00 NE B SRS ]
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e 78,000.00 NO BID NOBID _
126 | 20,000.00 NOBID NO B -
127 — NO BID 1,600.00 :
128 — NO BID NO BID ]
128 | 2460000 7,015.70 NGO BID ]
130 | 5000000 7,015.70 NO BID ]
131 P NO BID NO BID ]
182 12,000.00 NG BIL ikt -
188 | somenap 11,458.94 22,000.00 2
184 | ggmen00 8,886.52 26,000.00 2
190 10,000.00 NO BID NOBID ]
186 | ugannon 22,450.16 NG BID -
137 B NO BID 2,800.00 1
138 p— NO BID 2,800.00 1
139 | 1000000 NO BID 6,800.00 1
140 5 568 NO BID NO BID -
141 o NO BID 7,600.00 .
142 — NO BID 8,000.00 1
143 — NO BID N B0 .
144 6 030,00 NO BID NO BID .
145 — NO BID 1,500.00 1
146 —_—— NO BID NO BID -
147 15,000.00 NQ BID e EiR ]
148 e NO BID NO BID -
149 — NO BID NO BID -
120 20,000.00 NOBID e ]
B | g 29,272.32 NG BID -
152 T NO BID 2,000.00 1
153 - NO BID 3,960.00 1
| s s NO BID 13,050.00 1
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155 255 NO BID - LEl ]
156 —— NO BID - NO BID -
157 7.000.00 NO BID i 7,000.00 1
158 | 33440.00 NG EID _ NO B _
159 _— NO BID - NO BID -
160 — NO BID - NOBID ]
161 — NO BID - NGB ]
162 - NO BID - NO BID -
163 14,600.01 NG Bil - NO B -
. 16,800.00 NO BID ] NO B -
165 3.000.00 NO BID - NO BID .

NOW, THEREFORE, based on the foregoing findings, WE, the members of the
Bids and Awards Committee, hereby RESOLVE, as it is hereby RESOLVED:

(a) to declare Glenwood Technologies International Inc., as the bidder with the
Lowest Calculated Bid (LCB)/ Single Calculated Bid (SCB) with an aggregate
amount of P 258,936.51 for the following item numbers.

Item No. 19 with the bid price of P 7,249.54,
Iltem No. 49 with the bid price of # 3,390.91,
Item No. 51 with the bid price of P 4, 677.12,
Item No. 55 with the bid price of P 4,443.26,
Item No. 58 with the bid price of # 3,040.13,
Item No. 59 with the bid price of P 4,092.48,
| Iltem No. 60 with the bid price of  4,443.26,
| Item No. 65 with the bid price of ® 19,877.75,
| Item No. 66 with the bid price of P 5,846.40,
| Item No. 67 with the bid price of ® 4,677.12,
| Item No. 75 with the bid price of # 4,560.19,
Item No. 80 with the bid price of  7,249.54,
Item No. 81 with the bid price of P 7,249.54,
Item No. 85 with the bid price of P 3,624.77,
Item No. 86 with the bid price of ® 2,455.49,
Item No. 91 with the bid price of # 11,926.65,
Item No. 100 with the bid price of # 3,858.62,
Item No. 101 with the bid price of # 1,870.85,
Item No. 103 with the bid price of  3,390.91,
Item No. 104 with the bid price of £ 3,040.13,
Item No. 105 with the bid price of P 4,092.48,
Item No. 106 with the bid price of P 4,443.26,
Item No. 107 with the bid price of P 2,923.20,
Item No. 108 with the bid price of P 4,677.12,
Item No. 109 with the bid price of # 3,624.77,
Item No. 110 with the bid price of P 3,624.77,
Item No. 112 with the bid price of ® 3,624.77,
ltem No. 113 with the bid price of ® 2,455.49,
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Item No
ltem No
ltem No
ltem No
ltem No
ltem No
Iltem No
ltem No
Iltem No
ltem No
Iltem No
ltem No

O

. 114 with the bid price of # 3,975.55,
. 116 with the bid price of # 7,033.28,
. 117 with the bid price of  3,858.62,
. 118 with the bid price of # 1,870.85,
. 119 with the bid price of # 3,390.91,

. 120 with the bid price of P 12,277 .44,

. 129 with the bid price of  7,015.70,
. 130 with the bid price of # 7,015.70,

. 133 with the bid price of # 11,458.94,

. 134 with the bid price of # 8,886.52,

. 136 with the bid price of # 22,450.16,
. 151 with the bid price of  29,272.32,

(b) to declare Mt. Zion Scientific Inc., as the bidder with the Lowest Calculated Bid
(LCB) / Single Calculated Bid (SCB) with an aggregate amount of # 332,449.00
for the following item numbers.

ltem No
Iltem No
ltem No
Iltem No

ltem No.
ltem No.
ltem No.
Iltem No.
ltem No.
Iltem No.
ltem No.
ltem No.
ltem No.
ltem No.
ltem No.
ltem No.
Iltem No.
Item No.
ltem No.
Iltem No.
ltem No.
Item No.
ltem No.
Iltem No.
ltem No.
ltem No.
Iltem No.
ltem No.
Iltem No.
ltem No.
Iltem No.
ltem No.
Iltem No.
ltem No.
ltem No.

ltem No
Item No
Iltem No
ltem No

. 1 with the bid price of  9,252.00,

. 3 with the bid price of # 9,252.00,

. 12 with the bid price of £ 3,200.00,

. 18 with the bid price of # 4,700.00,
22 with the bid price of  4,000.00,
23 with the bid price of £ 35,000.00,
28 with the bid price of £ 7,000.00,
29 with the bid price of £ 3,000.00,
31 with the bid price of # 3,000.00,
33 with the bid price of # 3,930.00,
34 with the bid price of # 4,500.00,
35 with the bid price of # 8,000.00,
36 with the bid price of # 9,800.00,
38 with the bid price of # 7,680.00,
39 with the bid price of # 20,000.00,
40 with the bid price of # 14,000.00,
44 with the bid price of £ 6,000.00,
54 with the bid price of # 3,625.00,
56 with the bid price of  6,000.00,
61 with the bid price of £ 2,000.00,
62 with the bid price of # 10,000.00,
71 with the bid price of £ 22,000.00,
72 with the bid price of  16,500.00,
88 with the bid price of # 8,000.00,
92 with the bid price of # 8,900.00,
94 with the bid price of # 3,000.00,
95 with the bid price of # 3,000.00,
96 with the bid price of # 3,000.00,
98 with the bid price of # 31,200.00,

137 with the bid price of # 2,800.00,
138 with the bid price of £ 2,800.00,
139 with the bid price of  6,800.00,
142 with the bid price of  8,000.00,
145 with the bid price of # 1,500.00,
. 152 with the bid price of £ 2,000.00,
. 153 with the bid price of  3,960.00,

. 154 with the bid price of  13,050.00,

. 157 with the bid price of # 7,000.00,

121 with the bid price of # 15,000.00,
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(c) to direct the TWGs to proceed with the Post—Qualification Evaluation of the
LCB and SCB and report their findings to the BAC within the prescribed period.

(d) to declare a Failure of Bidding for Item Nos.10, 45, 73, 127 and 141 bids
exceeded the allotted budget and,

(e) to declare a Failure of Bidding for Item Nos. 2, 4, 5,6, 7, 8, 9, 11, 13, 14, 15,
16, 17, 20, 21, 24, 25, 26, 27, 30, 32, 37, 41,42, 43, 46, 47, 48, 50, 52, 53, 57,
63, 64, 68, 69, 70, 74, 76, 77, 78, 79, 82, 83, 84, 87, 89, 90, 93, 97, 99, 102,
111, 115, 122, 123, 124, 125, 126, 128, 131, 132, 135, 140, 143, 144, 146,
147, 148, 149, 150, 155, 156, 158, 159, 160, 161, 162, 163, 164 and 165 no
bid was received,

(f) to recommend to the President the procurement of the following ltem Nos. 2,
4,56,7,8,9 10, 11, 13,14, 15, 16, 17, 20, 21, 24, 25, 26, 27, 30, 32, 37, 41,
42, 43,45, 46,47,48,50, 52, 53, 57, 63, 64, 68,69, 70, 73, 74,76, 77, 78, 79,
82, 83, 84, 87, 89, 90, 93, 97, 99, 102, 111, 115, 122, 123, 124, 125, 126, 127,
128, 131, 132, 135, 140, 141, 143, 144, 146, 147, 148, 149, 150, 1565, 156,
158, 159, 160, 161, 162, 163, 164 and 165 of the project Supply and Delivery
of Laboratory Chemicals and Reagents (APP 2023), Rebid using the
appropriate alternative mode of procurement.

RESOLVED, at TSU-BC AVR, this 7" day of February 2024.

MURPHY P. MOHAMMED RICO /{M

Chairperson / Member
THEDA FLARE G QUILALA JASPER A~ ;AUDER
Member __—Member

EW/W TEOFILO

" Me ber nd-user

Ap:éW
DR. ARNOLD E. VELASCO

rdsident
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