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Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE FOR GOODS AND SERVICES
Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING THE LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE
BID (LCRB) AND RECOMMENDING THE AWARD OF CONTRACT

RESOLUTION NO. PB068-2023

BIDDING NO.: PURCHASE REQUEST NO. 2023-05-171

Category per RA9184: [X] GOODS [] INFRA/WORKS [] CONSULTING
TITLE/DESCRIPTION: “SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF BOOKS (APP 2023)”
APPROVED BUDGET FOR THE CONTRACT (ABC): * 14,865,535.00

WHEREAS, the TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY advertised the Invitation to Bid for
the project Supply and Delivery of Books (APP 2023) with an Approved Budget for the
Contract (ABC) of ® 14,865,535.00 in the Philippine Government Electronic Procurement
System (PhilGEPS) and in conspicuous places in Tarlac State University on July 26,
2023;

WHEREAS, in response to the Invitation to Bid, three (3) prospective bidders
participated in the Pre-Bidding Conference held at Tarlac State University Business
Center Audio Visual Room (TSU-BC AVR) on August 3, 2023;

WHEREAS, in the public bidding held at the Business Center Audio Visual Room
(TSU-BC AVR) on August 15, 2023, at2 P.M.:

(@) Three bidders, namely, C&E Publishing Inc., New Century Books & General
Merchandise, and Infopage Education Services Inc. tendered their bids for the
aforementioned project,

(b) the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC), with the assistance of the Technical
Working Groups (TWGs), opened and checked the first envelopes contained
in the bids submitted by the three bidders, using the non-discretionary
“pass/fail” criterion, and found the first envelopes of C&E Publishing Inc., New
Century Books & General Merchandise, and Infopage Education Services Inc.
tc contain all the required documents and were rated “passed”.

{c) the BAC, with the assistance of the TWGs, evaluated and ranked the bids of
the three bidders whose first envelopes were rated “passed”,

(d) to declare New Century Books & Gen. Merchandise as the bidder with the
Single Calculated Bid (SCB) for the following lot numbers:

Lot No. 1 with the bid price of # 139,237.25,
Lot No. 2 with the bid price of ® 181,850.00,
Lot No. 3 with the bid price of P 304,688.75,
Lot No. 4 with the bid price of P 726,600.75,
Lot No. 5 with the bid price of ® 235,252 .10,
Lot No. 6 with the bid price of P 196,760.75,
Lot No. 7 with the bid price of ® 350,405.25,
Lot No. 8 with the bid price of ® 1,280,861.50,
Lot No. 9 with the bid price of # 511,178.00,
Lot No. 10 with the bid price of # 701,697.50,
Lot No. 11 with the bid price of ® 825,547.75,
Lot No. 12 with the bid price of ® 1,192, 538.75,
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Lot No. 13 with the bid price of ® 363,698.55,
Lot No. 14 with the bid price of # 11,779.00,
Lot No. 15 with the bid price of ® 318,380.00,
Lot No. 16 with the bid price of P 474,855.50,
Lot No. 17 with the bid price of P 95,306.75,
Lot No. 18 with the bid price of ® 203,489.25,
Lot No. 20 with the bid price of P 608,538.10,
Lot No. 21 with the bid price of ® 1,121,059.25,
Lot No. 22 with the bid price of  213,940.75,
Lot No. 23 with the bid price of f* 624,098.75,
Lot No. 24 with the bid price of ® 642,333.50,
Lot No. 26 with the bid price of  355,738.00,
Lot No. 27 with the bid price of ® 94,663.50,
Lot No. 28 with the bid price of P 4,189.00,
Lot No. 29 with the bid price of  353,036.35,
Lot No. 30 with the bid price of ® 135,063.35,
Lot No. 31 with the bid price of P 42,005.00,
Lot No. 32 with the bid price of ® 95, 007.00

(e) to declare Infopage Education Services, Inc. as the bidder with the Lowest
Calculated Bid (LCB) for Lot No. 19 with the bid price of P 1,334,670.00,

(f) the BAC resolved to declare C & E Publishing Inc. as the bidder with the Single
Calculated Bid (SCB) for Lot No. 25, with the bid price of  946,605.00.

(g) the BAC directed the TWGS to proceed with the post-qualification evaluation of
the LCBs;

WHEREAS, in the Post-Qualification Evaluation Conference held at the Business
Center Audio Visual Room (TSU-BC AVR) on September 28, 2023.

(a) the TWG for the Legal and Financial Aspects reported that the SCBs and LCB
were responsive to the legal and financial requirements for the project as
prescribed in the Bidding Documents,

(b) the TWG for Technical Aspect reported that the SCBs and LCB were
responsive to the technical requirements for the project as prescribed in the
Bidding Documents, and,

(c) the BAC verified the reports of the TWGs, deliberated, and unanimously
agreed to declare the SCBs and LCB as responsive;

THEREFORE, We, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby
RESOLVE, as it is hereby RESOLVED:

(a) to declare New Century Books & General Merchandise, as the bidder with
the Single Calculated and Responsive Bid (SCRB) for for Lot Nos. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5,
6,7,8 9 10, 11,12, 13, 14,15, 16, 17, 18, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 26, 27, 28, 29,
30, 31 and 32, with an aggregate bid price of  12,403,899.95,

(b) to declare Infopage Education Services, Inc. as the bidder with the Lowest
Calculated and Responsive Bid (LCRB) for Lot No. 19 with the bid price of ®
1,334,670.00.

(c) to declare C & E Publishing Inc. as the bidder with the Single Calculated and
Responsive Bid (SCRB) for Lot No. 25 with the bid price of ® 946,605.00.
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(d) to recommend to the President the Award of Contract for the project Supply
and Delivery of Books (APP 2023) fo New Century Books & General

Merchandise for Lot Nos. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5. 6,7, 8.9 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17,
18, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 26, 27, 2’8, 29, 30, 31 and 82, Infopage Education
Services, inc. for Lot No: 18., and C & E Publishing Inc. for Lol No. 25.

RESOLVED, at TSU-BC AVR, this 28" day of September 2023

MURPHY P, MOHAMMED
Chairpersan

THEDA FLL‘RE“’G QUILALA JASPER. éﬁé
Member

Member
ﬁ Lu«ﬁ"

iCY’NTHIA M. BQGNDT

Member/End-user

Page 3 cif 3

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING THE LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BID (LCRE) AND
RECOMMENDING THE AWARD OF CONTRACT

RESOLUTION NO. PB0&8-2023




A N

Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Romulo Bivd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS READ

Project Name: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF BOOKS (APP 2023)

Project Location: Main Campus, Tarlac State University Date: August 15, 2023
Implementing Office: Tarlac State University Time: 2:00 P.M.
Approved Budget for the Contract: ® 14,865,535.00 Venue: BC-AVR
BIDDER C&E "I‘;g"s'““g sél'i"; gegttel_rllrgral EI:L.ocpailg:n
: Merchandise Services Inc.
Lot No. 1 NO BID #139,237.25 NO BID
Lot No. 2 NO BID 181,850.00 NO BID
Lot No. 3 NO BID P304.688.75 NO BID
Lot No. 4 NO BID 726,600.75 NO BID
LotNo. 5 NC BID $#235,252.10 NO BID
Lot No. 6 NO BID #196,760.75 NO BID
Lot No. 7 NO BID #350,405.25 NO BIiD
Lot No. 8 NO BID 1,280,861.50 NO BID
Lot No. 9 NO BID #511,178.00 NO BID
Lot No. 10 NG BID #701,697.50 NO BID
Lot No. 11 NO BID P825,547.75 NO BID
Lot No. 12 NO BID 1,192,538.75 NO BID
Lot No. 13 NO BID $363,698.55 NO BID
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Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Romulo Bivd., San Vicente, Tarac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

Lot No. 14 NO BID #11,779.00 NO BID
Lot No. 15 NO BID #318,380.00 NO BID
Lot No. 16 NO BID ®474,955.50 NO BID
Lot No. 17 NO BID 95,306.75 NO BID
Lot No. 18 NO BID 1#203,489.26 NO BID
Lot No. 19 NO BID 1*1,334,868.80 #1,334,870.00
Lot No. 20 NO BID P608,538.10 NO BID
Lot No. 21 NO BID 1,121,059.25 NO BID
Lot No. 22 NO BID $213,940.75 NO BID
Lot No. 23 NO BID P624,008.75 NO BID
Lot No. 24 NO BID #642,333.50 NO BID
Lot No. 25 #946,605.00 NO BID NO BID
Lot No. 26 NO BiD #355,738.00 NO BID
Lot No. 27 NO BID #94,663.50 NO BID
Lot No. 28 NO BID #4,189.00 NO BiD
Lot No. 29 NO BID 1#353,036.35 NO BID
Lot No. 30 NO BID #135.063.35 NO BID
Lot No. 31 NO BID #42,005.00 NO BID
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Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
Remulc Bivd.. San Vieante, Tariae City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-a430
Wabsite; www tiu edu.ph

Lot No. 32 NOBID |  ®g5,007.00 NO BID
Form of Bid Bid Securing Bid Securing Bid Securing
Security Declaration Declaration Declaration
Validity Period 120 days 120 days 120 days
Remarks Complying Complying Complying

MURPHY g OHAMMED

Chairperson
< ;ﬂv
THEDA FLARE G. QUILALA JASPER A-VAUDER
Member ~ Member
[__f{_',x-:'“l, .
CYNTHIA M. BOGNOT
Member/End-user

TWG on Firaricial 8

Chaifgarsan

Approved:
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Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS CALCULATED

Project Name: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF BOOKS (APP 2023)

Project Location: Main Campus, Tarlac State University Date: August 15, 2023
Implementing Office: Tarlac State University Time: 2:00 P.M.
Approved Budget for the Contract: ® 14,865,535.00 Venue: BC-AVR
BIDDER C&E Publishing Bc?tl)e!:; g;eg;t:l?ral E"(;{locpa:?:n
Inc. Merchandise Services Inc.
Lot No. 1 NO BID #139,237.25 NO BiD
Lot No. 2 NO BID #181,850.00 NO BID
Lot No. 3 NO BiD #304,688.75 NO BID
Lot No. 4 NO BID #726,600.75 NO BID
LotNc. 5 NO BID #235,252.10 NO BID
Lot No. 6 NO BID 196,760.75 NO BID
Lot No.7 NO BID #350,405.25 NO BIiD
Lot No. 8 NO BID 1,280,861.50 NO BID
Lot No. 9 NO BID #511,178.00 NO BID
Lot No. 10 NO BID P701,697.50 NO BID
Lot No. 11 NO BID #825,547.75 NO BID
Lot No. 12 NO BID #1,192,538.75 NO BID
Lot No. 13 NO BID 363,698.55 NO BID
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Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Romulo Bivd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Website: www.tsu.edu.ph

Lot No. 14 NO BID #11,779.00 NO BID
Lot No. 15 NO BID #318,380.00 NO BID
Lot No. 16 NO BID P474,955.50 NO BID
Lot No. 17 NO BID #95,308.75 NO BID
Lot No. 18 NO BID $203,489.25 NO BID
Lot No. 19 NO BID ®1,334,868.80 1,334,670.00
Lot No. 20 NO BID #608,538.10 NO BID
Lot No. 21 NO BID P1,121,059.25 NO BID
Lot No. 22 NO BID P213,940.75 NO BID
Lot No. 23 NO BID 624,098.75 NO BID
Lot No. 24 NO BID 642,333.50 NO BID
Lot No. 25 946,605.00 NO BID NO BID
Lot No. 26 NO BID 355,738.00 NO BID
Lot No. 27 NO BID 94,663.50 NO BID
Lot No. 28 NO BID 4,189.00 NO BID
Lot No. 29 NO BID #353,036.35 NO BID
Lot No. 30 NO BID ?135,063.35 NO BID
Lot No. 31 NO BID #42,005.00 NO BID
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Republic cf the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
Remulo Bivd., Sen Vicente. Tarlac City
Tel, No: (045) 982-4630
Website: waw, s edu.ph

Lot No. 32 NO BID '1#96,007.00 NOBID
Form of Bid Bid Secuiing Bid Securing Bid Securing
Security Declaration Declarafion Declaration
Validity Period 120 days 120 days 120 days
Remarks Complying Complying Complying

MURPHY B, MOHAMMED
Chairperson

e —
~ '\-ﬂl

THEDA FLARE'G. QUILALA ASP AUDER
Member - Member

— -

{( Nrppe L—

CYNTHIA M, BOGNOT
Member/End-user

RYAN G. SIH

TWE on Tgchnical Aspects
Chairgarson
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Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE FOR GOODS AND SERVICES
Romulo Blvd., San Vicente, Tarlac City

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING THE LOWEST CALCULATED BID (LCB) / SINGLE
CALCULATED BID (SCB)

RESOLUTION NO. PB047-2023

BIDDING NO.: PURCHASE REQUEST NO. 2023-05-171
Category per RA9184: [X] GOODS [] INFRA/WORKS [] CONSULTING
TITLE/DESCRIPTION: “SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF BOOKS (APP 2023)”
APPROVED BUDGET FOR THE CONTRACT (ABC): P 14,865,535.00

WHEREAS, the TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY advertised the invitation to Bid for
the project Supply and Delivery of Books (APP 2023) with an Approved Budget for the
Contract (ABC) of ™ 14,865,535.00 in the Philippine Government Electronic Procurement
System (PhilGEPS) and in conspicuous places in Tarlac State University on July 28,
2023,

WHEREAS, in response to the Invitation to Bid, three (3) prospective bidders
participated in the Pre-Bidding Conference held at Tarlac State University Business
Center Audio Visual Room (TSU-BC AVR) and webcasted via Zoom on August 3,2023.

WHEREAS, in the public bidding held at the TSU-BC AVR on August 15, 2023, at
2:00 P.M. three (3) bidders, namely, C&E Publishing Inc., New Century Books & General
Merchandise, and Infopage Education Services Inc. participated and tendered their bids
for the aforementioned project:

WHEREAS, the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC), with the assistance of the
Technical Working Groups (TWGS), opened and checked the first envelopes contained
in the bids submitted by the three bidders, using the non-discretionary “pass/fail” criterion,
and found that the first envelopes of C&E Publishing Inc., New Century Books & General
Merchandise, and Infopage Education Services Inc. contained all the required documents
and were rated “passed”:

WHEREAS, the BAC with the assistance of the TWGs, proceeded with the
opening and evaluation of the second envelopes of the four bidders and found that the
envelopes of the three bidders contained the prescribed documents and were rated
“passed”;

WHEREAS, the BAC with the assistance of the TWGs, proceeded with the
evaluation of the financial bids of the three bidders with the results as summarized below:

Bidder
I New Century Books | Infopage Education
Lot C&E Publishing Inc. & Gen. Marchandise Services Inc.
No ABC, # Bid Price (As
' Bid Price (As Bid Price (As
Calculated), P Rank Calculated), ® Rank Calcu’lated), Rank
1 141,440.00 NO BID - 139,237.25 1 NO BID -
182,1960.00 NO BID - 181,850.00 1 NC BID -
3 306,038.00 NQ BID - 304,688.75 1 NO BID -
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4 732,027.00 NO BID 726,600.75 1 NO BID
5 236,930.00 NO BID 235,252.10 1 NO BID
6 197,210.00 NO BID 196,760.75 1 NO BID
7 360,882.00 NO BID 350,405.25 1 NO BID
8 1,330,144.00 NO BID 1,280,861.50 1 NO BID
9 525,332.00 NO BID 511,178.00 1 NO BID
10 703,466.00 NO BID 701,697.50 1 NO BID
11 837,370.00 NO BID 825,547.75 1 NO BID
12 | 1,198,970.00 NO BID 1,192,538.75 1 NO BID
13 370,719.00 NO BID 363,698.55 1 NO BID
14 12,048.00 NO BID 11,779.00 1 NO BID
15 318,940.00 NO BID 318,380.00 1 NO BID
16 479,861.00 NO BID 474,955.50 1 NO BID
17 97,106.00 NO BID 95,306.75 1 NO BID
18 205,344.00 NO BID 203,489.25 1 NO BID
19 | 1,339,474.00 NO BID 1,334,868.80 2 [1,334,670.00
20 625,813.00 NO BID 608,538.10 1 NO BID
21 | 1,134,443.00 NO BID 1,121,059.25 1 NO BID
22 214,600.00 NO BID 213,940.75 1 NO BID
23 624,668.00 NO BID 624,098.75 1 NO BID
24 653,969.00 NO BID 642,333.50 1 NO BID
25 948,525.00 946,605.00 NO BID - NO BID
26 357,118.00 NO BID 355,738.00 1 NO BID
27 96,282.00 NO BID 94,663.50 1 NO BID
28 4,289.00 NO BID 4,189.00 1 NO BID
29 356,851.00 NO BID 353,036.35 1 NO BID
30 135,923.00 NO BID 135,063.35 1 NO BID
31 42,075.00 NO BID 42,005.00 1 NO BID
32 95,387.00 NO BID 95,007.00 1 NO BID

NOW, THEREFORE, based on the foregoing findings, WE, the members of the

Bids and Awards Committee, hereby RESOLVE, as it is hereby RESOLVED:

(a) to declare New Century Books & Gen. Merchandise as the bidder with the
Single Calculated Bid (SCB) for the following lot numbers:

Lot No. 1 with the bid price of ® 139,237.25,
Lot No. 2 with the bid price of ® 181,850.00,
Lot No. 3 with the bid price of ® 304,688.75,
Lot No. 4 with the bid price of ® 726,600.75,
Lot No. 5 with the bid price of ® 235,252.10,
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Lot No 6 with the bid price of P 186,760.75.
Lot No. 7 with the bid price of P 350,405 .25,
Lot No. 8 with the bid price of P 1,280,861 .50,
Lot No. @ with the bid price of P 511,178.00.
Lot No. 10 with the bid price of P 701,697.50,
Lot No. 11 with the bid price of P 825,547.75,
Lot No. 12 with the bid price of P 1,192,538,75.
Lot No. 13 with the bid price of P 363 698 565,
Lot No. 14 with the bid price of 11,776:00,
Lot No. 15 with the bid price of # 318,380.00,
Lot No. 16 with the bid price of P 474, 955.50,
Lot No. 17 with the bid price of ® 85,306.75,
Lot No, 18 with the bid price of P 203,489.25,
Lot No. 20 with the bid price of P 608,535.10,
Lot No. 21 with the bid price of P 1,121,059.25,
Lot No. 22 with the bid price of ® 213,840.75,
Lot No. 23 with the bid price of P 624,098.75.
Lot No. 24 with the bid price of P 642,333,560,
Lot No. 26 with the bid price of P 355,738.00,
Lot No. 27 with the bid price of # 94,663,50,
Lot No. 28 with the bid price of P 4,189 .00,

Lot No. 29 with the bid price of ® 353.036.335,
Lot No. 30 with the bid price of # 135,063.35,
Lot No. 31 with the bid price of P 42 005.00, and
Lot No. 32 with the bid price of P 85,007.00

(b) to declare Infopage Education Services, Inc. as the bidder with the Lowest
Calculated Bid (LCB) for Lot No. 19 with the bid price of ® 1,334,670.00.

(c) to declare CAE Publishing Inc. as the bidder with the Single Calculated. Bid
(SCB) for Lot No. 25 with the bid price of ® 946,605.00,

(d) to direct the Technical Working Groups to proceed with the Post-Qualification
Evaluation of the LCBs and report their findings to the BAC within the
prescribed period.

RESOLVED, at TSU-BC AVR, this 15" day of August 2023.

MURPHY P. MOHAMMED

Chairperson

THEDA FLARE G. QUILALA JASPER é A‘)EDER
i : embear

CYNTHIA M. BOGNGT

Member/End-user
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