Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE FOR GOODS AND SERVICES
Romulo Bivd., San Vicente, Tarlac City

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING THE LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE
BID AND RECOMMENDING THE AWARD OF CONTRACT

RESOLUTION NO. PB008-2023

BIDDING NO.: PURCHASE REQUEST 2022-09-277

Category per RA9184: [ X ] GOODS []INFRA/WORKS [] CONSULTING
TITLE/DESCRIPTION: “SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF EQUIPMENT FOR USE IN THE
RESEARCH PROJECT: STANDARDIZATION OF PROCESS, PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS,
AND PACKAGING OF ARTISANAL “CHICHARON CAMILING” OF TARLAC PROVINCE”
APPROVED BUDGET FOR THE CONTRACT (ABC): ® 1,629,100.00

WHEREAS, the Tarlac State University advertised the invitation to Bid for the
project Supply and Delivery of Equipment for Use in the Research Project:
Standardization of Process, Product Specifications, and Packaging of Artisanal
“Chicharon Camiling” of Tarlac Province with an Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC)
of ® 1,629,100.00 in the Philippine Government Electronic Procurement System
(PhilGEPS) and in conspicuous places in Tarlac State University on October 22, 2022:

WHEREAS, in response to the Invitation to Bid, five (5) prospective bidders
participated in the Pre-Bidding Conference held at Tarlac State University Business
Center Audio Visual Room (TSU-BC AVR) and webcasted via Zoom on November 2,
2022,

WHEREAS, in the public bidding held at the TSU-BC AVR and webcasted via
Zoom on November 16, 2022, at 2:00 P.M.:

(a) four (4) bidders, namely, Labtraders Inc., Noveaulab Asia Corp., Diamond
Industrial Systems Provider Inc., and Golden Bat (Far East) Corp., tendered
their bids for the aforementioned project,

(b) the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC), with the assistance of the Technical
Working Groups (TWGs), opened and evaluated the bids of the four bidders
and were found to be substantially complying with the eligibility, technical, and
financial requirements for the project as prescribed in the Bidding Documents
and were rated “passed’,

(¢) the BAC evaluated and ranked the financial bids of the four bidders,

(d) the BAC resolved to declare Noveaulab Asia Corp., as the bidder with the
Lowest Calculated Bid (LCB) for Item No. 1 with bid price of P 762 ,635.00,

(e) the BAC resolved to declare Diamond Industrial Systems Provider Inc., as the
bidder with the LCB for Item No. 2 with bid price of # 430,000.00, and

(f) the BAC directed the TWGs to proceed with the Post-Qualification Evaluation
of the LCBs;

WHEREAS, in the Post-Qualification Evaluation Conference held at the TSU-BC
AVR and webcasted via Zoom on December 20, 2022:
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(a) the TWG for the Legal and Financial Aspects reported that the evidence
(Notice of Award, NTP, Certificate of Completion) to substantiate the the
SLCC claimed by the bidder with the LCB for Item No. 1 was inadvertently not
for the contract named in the SLCC,

(b) the TWG for the Technical Aspect reported that the LCB for ltem No.1 was
responsive to the technical requirements for the project as prescribed in the
bidding documents,

(c) the BAC verified the reports of the TWGs, deliberated, and upon motion duly
seconded, unanimously agreed to ask the bidder with the LCB for Item No. 1,
through the BAC Secretariat and the TWG for the Legal and Financial Aspect,
to submit the precise documents, within three days, and that failure of the
bidder to do so would warrant the declaration of the LCB for Item No. 1 as non-
responsive,

(d) the TWG for the Legal and Financial Aspects reported that the LCB for Item
No. 2 was responsive to the legal and financial requirements for the project,

(e) the TWG for the Technical Aspect reported that the LCB for ltem No. 2 failed
to comply with the technical specifications prescribed in the bidding
documents, specifically, the required equipment maximum operating
temperature of 425 °C,

(H the BAC verified the reports of the TWG, deliberated, and upon motion duly
seconded, declared the LCB for item No. 2 as non-responsive and post-
disqualified,

(g) the BAC directed the TWGs to proceed with the post-qualification evaluation
Labtraders Inc., the bidder with the second Lowest Calculated Bid for Item No.
2, and

(h) the BAC directed the Secretariat to issue the Notice of Disqualification to
Diamond Industrial Systems Provider Inc.

WHEREAS, in the Post-Qualification Evaluation Conference heid at the TSU-BC
AVR and webcasted via Zoom on January 6, 2023:

(a) the TWG for the Legal and Financial Aspects reported that the bidder with LCB
for Item No.1 was able to furnish the BAC Secretariat with the evidence (Notice
of Award, NTP, Certificate of Completion), as required, and that they were able
to verify that the SLCC claimed was genuine,

(b) the BAC, verified the report of the TWG for the Legal and Financial Aspects,
deliberated, and upon motion duly seconded, agreed to declare the LCB for
ltem No. 1 as responsive,

(c) the TWG for the Legal and Financial Aspect reported that the bid of Labtraders,
inc. for ltem No. 2 was responsive to the prescribed legal and financial
requirements for the project,
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(d) the TWG for the Technical Aspect reported that the bid of Labtraders, Inc. for
ltem No. 2 was responsive to the prescribed technical requirements for the
project, and

(e) the BAC verified the reports of the TWGs. deliberated, and upon motion duly
secondec, unanimously agreed to declare the bid of Labtraders, inc. for Item
No. 2 of the project as responsive;

THEREFORE, We, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby
RESOLVE, as it is hereby RESOLVED:

(8) to declare Noveaulab Asia Corp., as the bidder with the Lowest Calculated and
Responsive Bid (LCRB) for ltem No. 1 with bid price of P 762,635.00,

(b} to declars Labtraders Inc.. as the bidder with the LCRB for ltem No. 2 with
the bid price of ® 538,100.00, and

{c) to recommend to the President the Award of Caonfracts for Item No.1 to
Noveaulab Asia Corp., and ltem No. 2 to Labtraders Inc., of the project Supply
-and Delivery of Equipment for Use in the Research Project; Standardization of
Process, Product Specifications. and Packaging of Artisanal “Chicharon
Camiling” of Tarlac Province.

RESOLVED. at TSU-BC AVR, this 6% day of January 2023,
/1l
~

MURPHY P. MOHAMMED GHEROLD 0] BENITEZ

Chairpersan Vide Chalrperson
glﬁiﬁﬂhs
Member/End-User
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Republic of ihe Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
Romulo Bivd., San Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: (045) 982-4630
Wabsite: www, su.edu.ph

ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS READ

Project Name: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF EQUIPMENT FOR USE IN THE
RESEARCH PROJECT: STANDARDIZATION OF PROCESS, PRODUCT
SPECIFICATIONS, AND PACKAGING OF ARTISINAL “CHICHARON CAMILING” OF

TARLAC PROVINCE

Project Location: Lucinda Campus, Tarlac State University

Implementing Office: Tarlac State University
Approved Budget for the Contract: ® 1,629,100.00

Date: November 16, 2022
Time: 2:00 P.M.
Venue: BC-AVR / Zoom

Diamond Golden Bat
Noveaulab Industrial I (Far East)
BIQDER Asia Corp. | Systems Provider Labtraders Inc. Corp.
Inc.
Item No. 1 P 762,635.00 P 850,000.00 #1,050,000.00 | P 822,728.00
ltem No. 2 NO BID P 430,000.00 ® 539,100.00 NO BID
Form of Bid | Bid Securing Bid Securing Bid Securing Bid Securing
Security Declaration Declaration Declaration Declaration
Validity e »
Period 120 days 120 days 120 days 120 days
Remarks Complying Complying Complying Complying
I
MURPHY P. MOHAMMED
(ngirpersen

WINNIEFE K. GUTIERREZ

TWG on Finandal and Légal Aspects

Approved:

DR. ARNOKD E. VELASC

ident

Lgﬂ MATIAS

Member/End-User

RYAN

TWG on Tech ic;.ﬂ Aspects

Chairpprsan




Republic of the Philippines
TARLAC STATE UNIVERSITY
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

Romulo Bivd., Son Vicente, Tarlac City
Tel. No.: [D45) 982-4630
Website: www.isu.adu.ph

ABSTRACT OF BIDS AS CALCULATED

Project Name: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF EQUIPMENT FOR USE IN THE
RESEARCH PROJECT: STANDARDIZATION OF PROCESS, PRODUCT
SPECIFICATIONS, AND PACKAGING OF ARTISINAL “CHICHARON CAMILING" OF
TARLAC PROVINCE

Date: November 16, 2022
Time: 2200 P M,
Venue: BC-AVR / Zoom

Project Location: Lucinda Campus, Tarlac State University
Implementing Office: Tarlac State University
Approved Budget for the Contract: ® 1,629,100.00

| Diamond Golden Bat
Noveaulab Industrial _ : (Far East)
BIDDER Asia Corp. Systems Provider Labtraders Inc. Corp.
Ine.
ftem No. 1 P 762,635.00  850,000.00 #1.050,000.00 | P822,728.00
ltem No. 2 NO BID # 430,000.00 P 539,100.00 NO BID
Form of Bid | Bid Securing Bid Securing Bid Securing Bid Securing
Security Declaration Declaration Declaration Declaration
Validity , . . .
Period 120 days 120 days 120 days 120 days
Remarks Complying Complying Complying Gomplying
i
MURPHY P, MOHAMMED
Chairperson

L‘E/iﬂﬁ;{ms

Member/End-User

TWG on Financial hd Legal Aspects
Chairperson

Approved:

DR. ARNOV E. VELASCO
résident




